

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

Exhibit C

TRIAL LAWYERS
TWO CANAL PLAZA
P.O. BOX 4600
PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/14/2016	RPC	Preliminary discussions of class action	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/16/2016	RPC	Preliminary discussions of class action	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/18/2016	RPC	Preliminary discussions of class action	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/22/2016	RPC	Reviewing class action issues / prior actions	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
11/23/2016	RPC	Reviewing class action issues / prior actions	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
11/29/2016	RPC	Pursuing amended pleadings/ conferring with co-counsel re motion practice/ counsel issues	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/1/2016	RPC	Pursuing amended pleadings/ conferring with co-counsel re motion practice/ counsel issues	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/6/2016	RPC	Conferring re amended pleadings. motion practice and discovery matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/8/2016	RPC	Conferring re amended pleadings. motion practice and discovery matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/13/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading matters / amended pleadings/ discovery	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/14/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading matters / amended pleadings/ discovery	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/15/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading matters / amended pleadings/ discovery	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/16/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading matters / amended pleadings/ discovery	1.00	700.00	700.00
12/19/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading and related matters	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
12/20/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading and related matters	1.20	700.00	840.00
12/21/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading and related matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
12/22/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading and related matters	1.10	700.00	770.00
12/23/2016	RPC	Pursuing pleading and related matters	0.80	700.00	560.00
12/27/2016	RPC	Reviewing pleadings/ motion practice /Conferring re amended pleadings. and discovery matters	1.10	700.00	770.00
12/28/2016	RPC	Reviewing pleadings/ motion practice /Conferring re amended pleadings. and discovery matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/2/2017	RPC	Pursuing motion practice	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/4/2017	RPC	Pursuing motion practice	0.90	700.00	630.00
1/6/2017	RPC	Pursuing motion practice	1.10	700.00	770.00
1/9/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order / meeting and conferring re same	1.10	700.00	770.00
1/10/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order / meeting and conferring re same	1.40	700.00	980.00
1/11/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order / meeting and conferring re same	0.80	700.00	560.00
1/12/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order / meeting and conferring re same	1.20	700.00	840.00
1/13/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order / meeting and conferring re same	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
1/16/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order and class cert issues / meeting and conferring re same / conferring re hearing	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
1/17/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order and class cert issues / meeting and conferring re same / conferring re hearing	2.00	700.00	1,400.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
1/18/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order and class cert issues / meeting and conferring re same / conferring re hearing	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/19/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order and class cert issues / meeting and conferring re same / conferring re hearing	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/20/2017	RPC	Pursuing protective order and class cert issues / meeting and conferring re same / conferring re hearing	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/1/2017	RPC	Review and pursue briefing re motion to dismiss / confer re discovery matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/2/2017	RPC	Review and pursue briefing re motion to dismiss / confer re discovery matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
3/3/2017	RPC	Review and pursue briefing re motion to dismiss / confer re discovery matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/6/2017	RPC	Pursue discovery strategy and pleading matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/7/2017	RPC	Pursue discovery strategy and pleading matters	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/8/2017	RPC	Pursue discovery strategy and pleading matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/14/2017	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / confer regarding discovery and motions	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/16/2017	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / confer regarding discovery and motions	1.20	700.00	840.00
3/20/2017	RPC	Pursuing matters pertinent to class certification issue / reviewing pleadings and resource material	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
3/21/2017	RPC	Pursuing matters pertinent to class certification issue / reviewing pleadings and resource material	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/22/2017	RPC	Pursuing matters pertinent to class certification issue / reviewing pleadings and resource material	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/23/2017	RPC	Pursuing matters pertinent to class certification issue / reviewing pleadings and resource material	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/24/2017	RPC	Pursuing matters pertinent to class certification issue / reviewing pleadings and resource material	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/28/2017	RPC	Looking at cert issues / reviewing earlier cases	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/29/2017	RPC	Looking at cert issues / reviewing earlier cases	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/30/2017	RPC	Looking at cert issues / reviewing earlier cases	1.00	700.00	700.00
5/3/2017	RPC	Pursuing insurance issues and pleading matters	0.75	700.00	525.00
7/12/2017	RPC	Conferring re motion practice and pleadings / reviewing materials	1.00	700.00	700.00
8/11/2017	RPC	Reviewing pleadings	0.75	700.00	525.00
9/4/2017	RPC	Reviewing materials / briefing re motion and oral argument	1.00	700.00	700.00
9/7/2017	RPC	Reviewing materials / briefing re motion and oral argument	0.75	700.00	525.00
9/12/2017	RPC	Conferring re status / motions and pleadings	0.50	700.00	350.00
9/13/2017	RPC	Conferring re status / motions and pleadings	1.00	700.00	700.00
11/28/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing materials / addressing pleading issues	0.75	700.00	525.00
11/29/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing materials / addressing pleading issues	1.25	700.00	875.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/4/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /conferring re documents and depositions	1.20	700.00	840.00
12/5/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /conferring re documents and depositions	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/6/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /conferring re documents and depositions	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
12/7/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /conferring re documents and depositions	1.60	700.00	1,120.00
12/8/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /conferring re documents and depositions	1.90	700.00	1,330.00
12/11/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	2.30	700.00	1,610.00
12/12/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	2.80	700.00	1,960.00
12/13/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
12/14/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	2.80	700.00	1,960.00
12/15/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	2.80	700.00	1,960.00
12/18/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	2.30	700.00	1,610.00
12/19/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	3.10	700.00	2,170.00
12/20/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / reviewing earlier Provider Power litigation documents / pursuing 30(b)	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
12/26/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters / pursuing expert matt	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
12/27/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters / pursuing expert matt	2.10	700.00	1,470.00
12/28/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters / pursuing expert matt	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
12/29/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters / pursuing expert matt	2.80	700.00	1,960.00
12/30/2017	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters / pursuing expert matt	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/2/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters pursuing expert matter	1.20	700.00	840.00
1/3/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters pursuing expert matter	1.50	700.00	1,050.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
1/4/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters pursuing expert matter	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
1/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery, pleading and expert issues / pursuing scheduling matters pursuing expert matter	2.60	700.00	1,820.00
1/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing elimination of affirmative defenses / pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matte	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
1/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing elimination of affirmative defenses / pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matte	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
1/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing elimination of affirmative defenses / pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matte	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
1/11/2018	RPC	Pursuing elimination of affirmative defenses / pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matte	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
1/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing elimination of affirmative defenses / pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matte	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
1/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing CMP and related discovery / pursuing matters pertinent to Door-to-Door fraud / pursuing in	1.00	700.00	700.00
2/22/2018	RPC	Updating on status / pursuing discovery matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
2/23/2018	RPC	Updating on status / pursuing discovery matters	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
2/26/2018	RPC	Court conference 2/26 / pursuing discovery matters / scheduling and conferring on status / reviewing	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
2/27/2018	RPC	Court conference 2/26 / pursuing discovery matters / scheduling and conferring on status / reviewing	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
2/28/2018	RPC	Court conference 2/26 / pursuing discovery matters / scheduling and conferring on status / reviewing	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/1/2018	RPC	Court conference 2/26 / pursuing discovery matters / scheduling and conferring on status / reviewing	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
3/2/2018	RPC	Court conference 2/26 / pursuing discovery matters / scheduling and conferring on status / reviewing	1.25	700.00	875.00
3/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling matters / reviewing documents	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling matters / reviewing documents	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling matters / reviewing documents	1.25	700.00	875.00
3/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling matters / reviewing documents	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
3/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling matters / reviewing documents	1.10	700.00	770.00
3/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
3/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
3/14/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	2.50	700.00	1,750.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
3/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
3/16/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/17/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters /	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
3/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / reviewing discovery responses / drafting motion to bar	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
3/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / reviewing discovery responses / drafting motion to bar	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/21/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / reviewing discovery responses / drafting motion to bar	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/22/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / reviewing discovery responses / drafting motion to bar	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/23/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / reviewing discovery responses / drafting motion to bar	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/26/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy	1.80	700.00	1,260.00
3/27/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy	1.25	700.00	875.00
3/28/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy	2.25	700.00	1,575.00
3/29/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
3/30/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy	1.00	700.00	700.00
4/2/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy and schedule	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
4/3/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy and schedule	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/4/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy and schedule	1.00	700.00	700.00
4/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy and schedule	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters/ reviewing documents and conferring re strategy and schedule	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
4/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters -- 30(b)(6) and requests for admission / reviewing documents	0.50	700.00	350.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
4/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters -- 30(b)(6) and requests for admission / reviewing documents	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
4/11/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters -- 30(b)(6) and requests for admission / reviewing documents	1.00	700.00	700.00
4/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters -- 30(b)(6) and requests for admission / reviewing documents	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
4/16/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition prep and discovery matters reviewing potential exhibits	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
4/17/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition prep and discovery matters reviewing potential exhibits	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
4/18/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition prep and discovery matters reviewing potential exhibits	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
4/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition prep and discovery matters reviewing potential exhibits	4.75	700.00	3,325.00
4/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition prep and discovery matters reviewing potential exhibits	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
4/23/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
4/24/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
4/25/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
4/26/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
4/27/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	4.75	700.00	3,325.00
4/28/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	4.75	700.00	3,325.00
4/29/2018	RPC	Deposition preparation/ resolving discovery issues and conferring re amended pleadings / hearing co	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
4/30/2018	RPC	Provider deposition	8.00	700.00	5,600.00
5/1/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition preparation; reviewing documents and materials; conferring re same	7.50	700.00	5,250.00
5/2/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition preparation; reviewing documents and materials; conferring re same	6.50	700.00	4,550.00
5/3/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition preparation; reviewing documents and materials; conferring re same	7.75	700.00	5,425.00
5/4/2018	RPC	Pursuing deposition preparation; reviewing documents and materials; conferring re same	8.25	700.00	5,775.00
5/7/2018	RPC	Continued deposition activity/ scheduling/ reviewing materials / investigative efforts	6.25	700.00	4,375.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
5/8/2018	RPC	Continued deposition activity/ scheduling/ reviewing materials / investigative efforts	6.75	700.00	4,725.00
5/9/2018	RPC	Continued deposition activity/ scheduling/ reviewing materials / investigative efforts	7.50	700.00	5,250.00
5/10/2018	RPC	Continued deposition activity/ scheduling/ reviewing materials / investigative efforts	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
5/11/2018	RPC	Continued deposition activity/ scheduling/ reviewing materials / investigative efforts	1.25	700.00	875.00
5/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing amended pleadings	1.25	700.00	875.00
5/16/2018	RPC	Pursuing amended pleadings	0.80	700.00	560.00
5/28/2018	RPC	Pursuing appeal brief and expert report / reviewing materials	5.00	700.00	3,500.00
5/29/2018	RPC	Pursuing appeal brief and expert report / reviewing materials	5.00	700.00	3,500.00
5/30/2018	RPC	Pursuing appeal brief and expert report / reviewing materials	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
6/4/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and review and investigation of related issues / reviewing documents and material	0.50	700.00	350.00
6/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and review and investigation of related issues / reviewing documents and material	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
6/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and review and investigation of related issues / reviewing documents and material	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
6/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and review and investigation of related issues / reviewing documents and material	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
6/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and review and investigation of related issues / reviewing documents and material	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
6/11/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / reviewing documents and pleadings / potential depositions	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
6/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / reviewing documents and pleadings / potential depositions	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
6/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / reviewing documents and pleadings / potential depositions	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
6/14/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / reviewing documents and pleadings / potential depositions	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
6/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / reviewing documents and pleadings / potential depositions	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
6/18/2018	RPC	Pursuing 3rd party discovery / reviewing materials pertinent thereto / following up on PUC matters	1.10	700.00	770.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
6/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing 3rd party discovery / reviewing materials pertinent thereto / following up on PUC matters	1.25	700.00	875.00
6/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing 3rd party discovery / reviewing materials pertinent thereto / following up on PUC matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
6/21/2018	RPC	Pursuing 3rd party discovery / reviewing materials pertinent thereto / following up on PUC matters	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
6/22/2018	RPC	Pursuing 3rd party discovery / reviewing materials pertinent thereto / following up on PUC matters	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
6/25/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re same	1.00	700.00	700.00
6/26/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re same	0.50	700.00	350.00
6/27/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re same	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
6/29/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re same	0.50	700.00	350.00
7/2/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters /Further investigation of door-to-door scheme / conferring	0.50	700.00	350.00
7/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters /Further investigation of door-to-door scheme / conferring	0.75	700.00	525.00
7/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters /Further investigation of door-to-door scheme / conferring	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
7/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters /Further investigation of door-to-door scheme / conferring	1.00	700.00	700.00
7/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re disputed matters / supplemental requests	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
7/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re disputed matters / supplemental requests	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
7/11/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re disputed matters / supplemental requests	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
7/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re disputed matters / supplemental requests	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
7/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters / conferring re disputed matters / supplemental requests	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
7/16/2018	RPC	Pursuing depositions and motion practice / reviewing documents and matters relating to allegations	6.50	700.00	4,550.00
7/17/2018	RPC	Pursuing depositions and motion practice / reviewing documents and matters relating to allegations	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
7/18/2018	RPC	Pursuing depositions and motion practice / reviewing documents and matters relating to allegations	2.50	700.00	1,750.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
7/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing depositions and motion practice / reviewing documents and matters relating to allegations	1.00	700.00	700.00
7/23/2018	RPC	Pursuing potential claims and motion practice / investigating third party litigation / review PUC a	1.30	700.00	910.00
7/24/2018	RPC	Pursuing potential claims and motion practice / investigating third party litigation / review PUC a	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
7/25/2018	RPC	Pursuing potential claims and motion practice / investigating third party litigation / review PUC a	1.00	700.00	700.00
7/26/2018	RPC	Pursuing potential claims and motion practice / investigating third party litigation / review PUC a	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
7/27/2018	RPC	Pursuing potential claims and motion practice / investigating third party litigation / review PUC a	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
7/31/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters // investigating third party litigation / review PUC action	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
8/1/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters // investigating third party litigation / review PUC action	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
8/2/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters // investigating third party litigation / review PUC action	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
8/3/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading matters // investigating third party litigation / review PUC action	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
8/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / reviewing strategy re further depositions and investigation	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
8/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / reviewing strategy re further depositions and investigation	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
8/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / reviewing strategy re further depositions and investigation	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
8/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / reviewing strategy re further depositions and investigation	1.00	700.00	700.00
8/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / reviewing strategy re further depositions and investigation	1.00	700.00	700.00
8/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery and scheduling issues	1.00	700.00	700.00
8/23/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / court conference and scheduling matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
8/24/2018	RPC	Pursuing pleading and discovery matters / court conference and scheduling matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
8/27/2018	RPC	Pursuing matters re PUC proceeding	0.50	700.00	350.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
8/28/2018	RPC	Pursuing matters re PUC proceeding	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
9/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / Reviewing transcripts and docs	1.25	700.00	875.00
9/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery / Reviewing transcripts and docs	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
9/24/2018	RPC	Pursuing motion practice re expert report	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
10/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing reply brief re expert report	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/1/2018	RPC	Reviewing response brief re expert matters & pursuing potential hearing preparation	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
11/2/2018	RPC	Reviewing response brief re expert matters & pursuing potential hearing preparation	1.00	700.00	700.00
11/3/2018	RPC	Reviewing response brief re expert matters & pursuing potential hearing preparation	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
11/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
11/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
11/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
11/9/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
11/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
11/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
11/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.25	700.00	1,575.00
11/14/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	0.50	700.00	350.00
11/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
11/16/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
11/17/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	3.00	700.00	2,100.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
11/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
11/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
11/23/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	1.00	700.00	700.00
11/26/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
11/27/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
11/28/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.50	700.00	3,150.00
11/29/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	6.50	700.00	4,550.00
11/30/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.25	700.00	2,975.00
12/3/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	5.00	700.00	3,500.00
12/4/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	6.00	700.00	4,200.00
12/5/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	6.50	700.00	4,550.00
12/6/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	7.00	700.00	4,900.00
12/7/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	7.00	700.00	4,900.00
12/8/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	5.00	700.00	3,500.00
12/10/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	4.75	700.00	3,325.00
12/11/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	5.75	700.00	4,025.00
12/12/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	6.00	700.00	4,200.00
12/13/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	8.00	700.00	5,600.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/14/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	6.00	700.00	4,200.00
12/15/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	5.00	700.00	3,500.00
12/17/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	7.75	700.00	5,425.00
12/18/2018	RPC	Pursuing resolution of motion practice / discovery matters / strategy meetings and discussions with	8.50	700.00	5,950.00
12/19/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / EM - Spark / Maine and Houston / strategy meetings and discussions wit	6.00	700.00	4,200.00
12/20/2018	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / EM - Spark / Maine and Houston / strategy meetings and discussions wit	6.50	700.00	4,550.00
1/2/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters directed at Spark / document requests / 30(b)(6) matters	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
1/3/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters directed at Spark / document requests / 30(b)(6) matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters directed at Spark / document requests / 30(b)(6) matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/7/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters directed at Spark / document requests / 30(b)(6) matters	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
1/15/2019	RPC	Conferring re Spark and EM discovery and pleading matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/18/2019	RPC	Conferring re Spark and EM discovery and pleading matters	0.75	700.00	525.00
1/22/2019	RPC	Pursuing review of status and discovery matters/ Tilton discovery matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/25/2019	RPC	Pursuing review of status and discovery matters/ Tilton discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
1/28/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery issues	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
1/29/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery issues	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/30/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery issues	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
1/31/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery issues	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
2/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/6/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/14/2019	RPC	Pursue discovery	1.00	700.00	700.00
2/15/2019	RPC	Pursue discovery	1.00	700.00	700.00
2/18/2019	RPC	Discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/19/2019	RPC	Discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/20/2019	RPC	Discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/21/2019	RPC	Discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
2/22/2019	RPC	Discovery matters	0.50	700.00	350.00
2/25/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / conferring re status	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
2/27/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery and pleading issues / conferring re status	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/5/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	2.40	700.00	1,680.00
3/6/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/7/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	1.00	700.00	700.00
3/8/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	0.50	700.00	350.00
3/10/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / briefing matters / class cert issues	1.25	700.00	875.00
3/11/2019	RPC	Pursuing class certification motion / discovery matters	0.75	700.00	525.00
3/12/2019	RPC	Pursuing class certification motion / discovery matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
3/13/2019	RPC	Pursuing class certification motion / discovery matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/14/2019	RPC	Pursuing class certification motion / discovery matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
3/15/2019	RPC	Pursuing class certification motion / discovery matters	2.25	700.00	1,575.00
3/18/2019	RPC	Pursuing class cert motion and related filings / declaration	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
3/19/2019	RPC	Pursuing class cert motion and related filings / declaration	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
3/20/2019	RPC	Pursuing class cert motion and related filings / declaration	4.75	700.00	3,325.00
3/21/2019	RPC	Pursuing class cert motion and related filings / declaration	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
3/22/2019	RPC	Pursuing class cert motion and related filings / declaration	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
3/25/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of discovery issues / follow up on class cert matters	2.25	700.00	1,575.00
3/26/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of discovery issues / follow up on class cert matters	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
4/1/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice re discovery and arbitration issues / preparing for and participating in h	1.25	700.00	875.00
4/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice re discovery and arbitration issues / preparing for and participating in h	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/8/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	0.75	700.00	525.00
4/9/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	0.75	700.00	525.00
4/10/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	1.25	700.00	875.00
4/11/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	1.25	700.00	875.00
4/17/2019	RPC	Pursuing investigation and discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/19/2019	RPC	Pursuing investigation and discovery matters / pursuing witnesses	0.75	700.00	525.00
4/22/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / EM 30(b)(6) matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
4/23/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / EM 30(b)(6) matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/24/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / EM 30(b)(6) matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
4/25/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / EM 30(b)(6) matters	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
4/26/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / EM 30(b)(6) matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
4/29/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery / potential witnesses	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
5/10/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
5/13/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / reviewing briefing	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
5/14/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / reviewing briefing	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
5/15/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / reviewing briefing	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
5/16/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / reviewing briefing	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
5/17/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / reviewing briefing	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
5/21/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / regulatory matters / deposition preparation	1.00	700.00	700.00
5/22/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / regulatory matters / deposition preparation	1.25	700.00	875.00
5/24/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / regulatory matters / deposition preparation	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
5/27/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
5/28/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
5/29/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
5/30/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
5/31/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
6/3/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
6/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
6/5/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
6/6/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	3.00	700.00	2,100.00
6/7/2019	RPC	Pursuing discovery, motion practice and potential settlement matters	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
6/10/2019	RPC	Pursuing reply and response briefs on pending motions	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
6/11/2019	RPC	Pursuing reply and response briefs on pending motions	2.75	700.00	1,925.00
6/12/2019	RPC	Pursuing reply and response briefs on pending motions	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
6/13/2019	RPC	Pursuing reply and response briefs on pending motions	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
6/14/2019	RPC	Pursuing reply and response briefs on pending motions	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
6/17/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / conferring re settlement matters / reviewing briefing	1.00	700.00	700.00
6/21/2019	RPC	Pursuing motion practice / conferring re settlement matters / reviewing briefing	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
6/24/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
6/25/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	3.50	700.00	2,450.00
6/26/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
6/27/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	4.25	700.00	2,975.00
6/28/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	4.00	700.00	2,800.00
6/29/2019	RPC	Pursuing briefing and mediation preparation	3.75	700.00	2,625.00
7/1/2019	RPC	Pursuing mediation	8.00	700.00	5,600.00
7/2/2019	RPC	Pursuing mediation	8.00	700.00	5,600.00
7/3/2019	RPC	Pursuing mediation	1.25	700.00	875.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
7/8/2019	RPC	Pursuing mediation follow-up	0.75	700.00	525.00
7/9/2019	RPC	Pursuing mediation follow-up	0.25	700.00	175.00
7/16/2019	RPC	Court conference/ conferring re same	0.75	700.00	525.00
8/23/2019	RPC	Conferring re settlement status	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
9/24/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters	1.00	700.00	700.00
10/17/2019	RPC	Settlement status inquiry	0.75	700.00	525.00
10/24/2019	RPC	Settlement status update	1.25	700.00	875.00
11/12/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / term sheet	1.25	700.00	875.00
11/14/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / term sheet	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
11/20/2019	RPC	Term sheet review and discussion	0.75	700.00	525.00
11/22/2019	RPC	Term sheet review and discussion	0.50	700.00	350.00
12/2/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / reviewing drafts and related materials pertinent to settlement	0.75	700.00	525.00
12/3/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / reviewing drafts and related materials pertinent to settlement	1.25	700.00	875.00
12/4/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / reviewing drafts and related materials pertinent to settlement	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/5/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / reviewing drafts and related materials pertinent to settlement	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/6/2019	RPC	Pursuing settlement matters / reviewing drafts and related materials pertinent to settlement	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/9/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of fee matters / conferring with counsel / conferring with Skadden / reviewing	1.25	700.00	875.00
12/10/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of fee matters / conferring with counsel / conferring with Skadden / reviewing	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/11/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of fee matters / conferring with counsel / conferring with Skadden / reviewing	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/12/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of fee matters / conferring with counsel / conferring with Skadden / reviewing	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/13/2019	RPC	Pursuing resolution of fee matters / conferring with counsel / conferring with Skadden / reviewing	1.50	700.00	1,050.00
12/16/2019	RPC	Pursuing preparation fee details for settlement purposes	1.00	700.00	700.00
12/17/2019	RPC	Pursuing preparation fee details for settlement purposes	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/18/2019	RPC	Pursuing preparation fee details for settlement purposes	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/19/2019	RPC	Pursuing preparation fee details for settlement purposes	2.50	700.00	1,750.00
12/20/2019	RPC	Pursuing preparation fee details for settlement purposes	1.75	700.00	1,225.00

For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced

THE CUMMINS LAW FIRM, P.C.

TRIAL LAWYERS
 TWO CANAL PLAZA
 P.O. BOX 4600
 PORTLAND, MAINE 04112-4600
 TELEPHONE: (207) 553-4712
 FACSIMILE: (207) 775-0806

ROBERT P. CUMMINS
 rpc@cumminslawfirm.com

Elec. Maine

Date : 1/20/2020

Invoice # : 1487

Matter # : Elec. Maine

Date	Attny	Description of Services Rendered / Costs Advanced	Hours	Rate	Amount
12/21/2019	RPC	Reviewing settlement documents	1.00	700.00	700.00
12/22/2019	RPC	Reviewing settlement documents	2.25	700.00	1,575.00
12/23/2019	RPC	Reviewing proposed settlement documents	2.00	700.00	1,400.00
12/24/2019	RPC	Reviewing proposed settlement documents	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
12/26/2019	RPC	Reviewing proposed settlement documents	0.75	700.00	525.00
12/27/2019	RPC	Reviewing proposed settlement documents	1.75	700.00	1,225.00
For Professional Services Rendered / Costs Advanced					\$584,150.00

Wiring Instructions: Camden National Bank; Account No. 15910110; The Cummins Law Firm; ABA No. 011201458