

Description	User	Date	Hours	Rate	Amount
Initial research and investigation regarding the possibility of pursuing a class-action against Electricity Maine.	Ben Donahue	9/2/2016	6.5	300	1950
Research Class Action case; discussion with BND regarding the same; T/C w/ private investigator Thornton.	Thomas Hallett	9/5/2016	3	300	900
Meet with investigator Thornton re investigation of Electricity Maine.	Ben Donahue	9/6/2016	0.6	300	180
Meeting with PI Thornton, Attorney Donahue and Attorney Weyrens re: investigations of complaints by Electricity Maine customers.	Thomas Hallett	9/6/2016	0.6	300	180
Multiple TC with Electricity Maine customers.	Ben Donahue	9/7/2016	1.5	300	450
Research unfair trade practices issues; examine power usage data compiled by the EIA; TCs with Electricity Maine customers; meeting with TFH regarding legal issues related to certfying a consumer class action.	Ben Donahue	9/8/2016	3.5	300	1050
T/C w/ Judy Montgomery; meeting with Attorney Donahue; review texts; research.	Thomas Hallett	9/8/2016	2.8	300	840
TC and meeting with Electricity Maine customers.	Ben Donahue	9/12/2016	0.7	300	210
TC with Electricity Maine customers regarding issues with re enrollment.	Ben Donahue	9/15/2016	1.8	300	540
Discussion with TFH regarding client meeting; TC with Kathy Veilleux regarding meeting on 9/23.	Ben Donahue	9/16/2016	1.2	300	360
Meeting with Ben Donahue regarding potential client.	Timothy E. Zerillo	9/16/2016	0.5	300	150
Travel to Hallowell to meet with Electricity Maine customer Kathy Veilleux.	Ben Donahue	9/23/2016	3.8	300	1140
Finalized letter to Electricity Maine, LLC.	Andrew Ambrose	9/26/2016	0.2	100	20
Draft letter to client regarding engagement and intial stages of class action proceeding.	Ben Donahue	9/26/2016	1.05	300	315
Begin drafting class action complaint	Ben Donahue	9/26/2016	5.75	300	1725
Review Electricity Maine advertising materials; TC with Electricity Maine customer.	Ben Donahue	9/26/2016	1	300	300
Finalize unfair trade practices notice letter before sending to Defendant.	Ben Donahue	9/26/2016	0.83	300	249
Draft letter to client regarding potential defendant contact.	Ben Donahue	9/26/2016	0.4	300	120
Revisions to letter demand letter to Electricity Maine.	Judy White	9/26/2016	0.2	100	20
Research class action pleading strategies; continue outlining draft complaint.	Ben Donahue	9/27/2016	1.8	300	540

Telephone conversation with Jen Chon regarding becoming class representative.	Ben Donahue	9/27/2016	0.3	300	90
Contact PUC; research PUC docket; meeting with Jen Chon; meeting with TFH.	Ben Donahue	9/28/2016	4.9	300	1470
Continue drafting complaint.	Ben Donahue	9/28/2016	3.02	300	906
Meeting with potential plaintiff; review materials; brainstorm with Attorney Donahue.	Thomas Hallett	9/28/2016	4.8	300	1440
Begin search for economist/statsatician.	Ben Donahue	9/29/2016	1.2	300	360
Draft fee agreement for class representatives.	Ben Donahue	9/29/2016	1.5	300	450
Legal research regarding unfair trade practices notice and class representatives.	Ben Donahue	9/29/2016	1.5	300	450
Communicate with potential plaintiffs; review Electricity Maine news coverage.	Ben Donahue	9/30/2016	1.4	300	420
TC with public advocate about EIA data.	Ben Donahue	9/30/2016	0.3	300	90
Review PUC filings: testimony, comments, and petitions regarding Electricity Maine investigation. Research regarding RICO pleading requirements.	Ben Donahue	10/2/2016	5.7	300	1710
Call with TFH regarding Electricity Maine customer service.	Ben Donahue	10/3/2016	0.3	300	90
Continue to research RICO pleading standards.	Ben Donahue	10/3/2016	0.5	300	150
Additional research on RICO pleading issues relating to enterprise liability.	Ben Donahue	10/4/2016	0.5	300	150
Research on RICO causation issues.	Ben Donahue	10/5/2016	0.7	300	210
Research on RICO causation and pleading issues.	Ben Donahue	10/6/2016	0.8	300	240
Expert witness research regarding regression analysis. Multiple email correspondence with clients regarding retainer agreement. Make changes to retainer agreement and send to clients.	Ben Donahue	10/11/2016	2.8	300	840
Analyze and download U.S. Energy Admin. data.	Ben Donahue	10/13/2016	1.4	300	420
Research potential expert witnesses; discuss expert issues with Attorney Zerillo.	Ben Donahue	10/17/2016	2.5	300	750
Meeting with TFH regarding complaint filing; causes of action.	Ben Donahue	10/17/2016	0.8	300	240
Meeting with Attorney Donahue to discuss strategy, venue and causes of action.	Thomas Hallett	10/17/2016	0.8	300	240
Research RICO proximate causation issues.	Ben Donahue	10/18/2016	0.8	300	240
Review Electricity Maine promotional materials.	Ben Donahue	10/21/2016	0.9	300	270
Research Rico issues and Draft Complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/22/2016	4	300	1200
Research Rico issues and Draft Complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/23/2016	3.8	300	1140
Investigate and review Electricity Maine materials; draft complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/24/2016	9	300	2700

Continue drafting Complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/25/2016	2.5	300	750
Continue drafting Complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/27/2016	2	300	600
Draft email to class representatives regarding status.	Ben Donahue	10/27/2016	0.3	300	90
Continue drafting Complaint.	Ben Donahue	10/27/2016	2.3	300	690
Draft complaint; research various RICO pleading issues.	Ben Donahue	10/28/2016	4.3	300	1290
Research mail and wire fraud issues.	Ben Donahue	11/1/2016	3.3	300	990
Draft complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/2/2016	5.3	300	1590
Meet w/BD, TFH, TZ	David A. Weyrens	11/2/2016	1	300	300
Meeting with counsel. Attorney Donahue advised as to status.	Thomas Hallett	11/2/2016	1	300	300
Meeting with BND and TFH regarding filing suit.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/2/2016	1	300	300
Draft complaint research various RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	11/3/2016	7.5	300	2250
Finish first draft of complaint; call potential experts.	Ben Donahue	11/4/2016	7.5	300	2250
Review complaint. Meeting with Attorney Donahue.	Thomas Hallett	11/4/2016	1.5	300	450
Review - revise complaint.	Thomas Hallett	11/5/2016	0.8	300	240
Begin drafting litigation hold notice.	Ben Donahue	11/6/2016	1	300	300
Revise complaint; multiple calls with expert witnesses.	Ben Donahue	11/7/2016	4.8	300	1440
Review expert resumes.	Ben Donahue	11/7/2016	0.5	300	150
Review complaint prior to filing.	David A. Weyrens	11/7/2016	0.5	300	150
Reviewing complaint. Brief research on RICO and UTPA. Searching for other torts. Researching Defendant's conspiracy case in New Hampshire. Meeting with Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/8/2016	2	300	600
Call with Renee at Greylock McKinnon regarding experts.	Ben Donahue	11/9/2016	0.2	300	60
Review expert resumes.	Ben Donahue	11/9/2016	0.5	300	150
Review complaint	David A. Weyrens	11/9/2016	1	300	300
Review expert resumes; discuss expert choice with Attorney Hallett.	Ben Donahue	11/10/2016	0.5	300	150
Team meeting regarding filing complaint; prepare for meeting.	Ben Donahue	11/10/2016	4.3	300	1290
Conference regarding complaint and strategies.	David A. Weyrens	11/10/2016	2.3	300	690
Conference regarding complaint and strategies.	Michael Whipple	11/10/2016	2.3	300	690
Conference regarding complaint and strategies.	Thomas Hallett	11/10/2016	2.3	300	690

Conference regarding complaint and strategies.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/10/2016	2.3	300	690
Revise complaint after team meeting.	Ben Donahue	11/11/2016	7.3	300	2190
Revise complaint; research regarding class certification issues and RICO personal jurisdiction issues.	Ben Donahue	11/12/2016	3.5	300	1050
Additional revisions to complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/13/2016	4.5	300	1350
Additional revisions to complaint; additional research regarding RICO issues; meeting with TFH regarding filing.	Ben Donahue	11/14/2016	7.4	300	2220
Meeting with Attorney Donahue re: filing in federal court.	Thomas Hallett	11/14/2016	0.8	300	240
Discuss expert witness issues with Attorney Hallett.	Ben Donahue	11/15/2016	0.7	300	210
Final substantive revisions to Complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/15/2016	2.8	300	840
T/C w/ Richard Tabors expert - retained; meeting with BND regarding the same.	Thomas Hallett	11/15/2016	1	300	300
Emails and calls regarding meeting with Attorney Cummins.	Ben Donahue	11/16/2016	0.2	300	60
Conference with Attorney Cummins and BND.	Thomas Hallett	11/16/2016	1	300	300
Meeting with Attorney Donahue and TEZ regarding case filing.	Thomas Hallett	11/17/2016	1.2	300	360
Meeting with Tom Hallett and Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/17/2016	1.2	300	360
Review/edit/prepare complaint, civil cover sheet, summons for complaint filing.	Athena Lavigne	11/18/2016	2	100	200
Review/edit/prepare complaint, civil cover sheet, summons for filing.	Athena Lavigne	11/18/2016	2	100	200
Pre-filing meeting with TEZ and TFH.	Ben Donahue	11/18/2016	1.2	300	360
Finalize complaint and associated documents; file complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/18/2016	6.3	300	1890
Meet w/BD re press stmt; Litigation hold issues.	David A. Weyrens	11/18/2016	0.6	300	180
Draft litigation hold notice; multiple email correspondence with Attorney Zerillo regarding handling inquires; respond to inquires.	Ben Donahue	11/19/2016	2.4	300	720
Dealing with Class Inquiries. Email from Donahue. Email to Donahue. Email to Donahue. Call with Ben. 2 emails Ben. Email Mike Whipple.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/19/2016	1.4	300	420
Veilleux printing and preparing civil cover sheets, copies of the complaint, summons', and requests for service.	Abigail J. Woodman	11/21/2016	0.75	100	75
Emails with client regarding filing complaint; prepare materials for service on defendants; communication with Electricity Maine customers; call with Attorney Jon Hinck.	Ben Donahue	11/21/2016	4.7	300	1410

Letters to Preserve to Electricity Maine, LLC, Power Provider, LLC and Spark HoldCo, LLC. Draft Proof of Service. Revisions to Request for Service forms.	Judy White	11/21/2016	0.8	100	80
Begin drafting written discover; meeting with Attorney Cummins; meeting with Attorney Hallett regarding next steps.	Ben Donahue	11/22/2016	8.9	300	2670
Draft form email to respond to inquires.	Ben Donahue	11/22/2016	0.3	300	90
Telephone conversation with AP reporter.	Ben Donahue	11/22/2016	0.2	300	60
T/C w/ experts; legal research regarding class certification discovery.	Thomas Hallett	11/22/2016	2.3	300	690
Work with email and call intake system to deal with high volume of calls from Electricity Maine customers.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/22/2016	1.2	300	360
Email to Dr. Tabors regarding complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/23/2016	0.3	300	90
Research class certification discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	11/25/2016	1.2	300	360
Work with Electricity Maine customer data from EIA.	Ben Donahue	11/27/2016	0.7	300	210
Field inquires from multiple reporters and journalists; meet with jouranalists; continue discovery planning; meeting with TFH regarding discovey.	Ben Donahue	11/28/2016	4	300	1200
Call from Brooke Soboleski at the Office of the Public Advocate. Email to Brooke Soboleski.	Judy White	11/28/2016	0.3	100	30
Meeting with Attorney Donahue. Review complaint. Meeting with reporters from WCSH and WGME.	Thomas Hallett	11/28/2016	1.5	300	450
Meeting with Abby Woodman re email and organization of Emails from Electricity Maine customers. Emails with website folks regarding banner, etc...Meeting with Ben Donahue. Researching local rules regarding speaking with the press. Replying to dozens of emails (80 emails or so today). Meeting with Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/28/2016	2.3	300	690
Meeting with TEZ regarding contact with Electricity Maine customers and managing their emails.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2016	0.6	300	180
Telephone conversation with Tim Scheider Maine Public Advocate.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2016	0.9	300	270
Email with expert regarding data.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2016	0.3	300	90
Handling more emails. Meeting with Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/29/2016	0.6	300	180
Prepare for call with expert.	Ben Donahue	11/30/2016	0.6	300	180
Telephone conversation with expert regarding data management.	Ben Donahue	11/30/2016	0.5	300	150
Handling more emails, Facebook messages.	Timothy E. Zerillo	11/30/2016	0.3	300	90

Telephone conversation with potential co-counsel.	Ben Donahue	12/1/2016	0.4	300	120
Meeting with Attorney Donahue. T/C with Attorney Pector; left message.	Thomas Hallett	12/1/2016	0.8	300	240
Review Judge Nivison recusal order; Meeting with Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	12/1/2016	0.2	300	60
Called Kennebec County Sheriff's Department regarding service on ElectricityMaine, called Androscoggin County Sheriff's Department regarding service on Provider Power, Clavet and Dean. Updated file.	Andrew Ambrose	12/2/2016	0.2	100	20
Research regarding post-complaint arbitration issues and class action waivers; meeting with Attorney Hallett	Ben Donahue	12/2/2016	2.5	300	750
Telephone with Attorney Cummins regarding arbitration issues.	Ben Donahue	12/2/2016	0.2	300	60
Review Spark purchase agreement; related documents.	Ben Donahue	12/2/2016	0.8	300	240
Meeting with Attorney Hinck. Meeting with Attorneys Zerillo, Whipple and Weyrens - strategy. Bringing on counsel. Meeting with Attorney Donahue. Submission of class action waivers by defendants.	Thomas Hallett	12/2/2016	2	300	600
Research regarding enterprise issues related to the amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/3/2016	1.8	300	540
Research regarding RICO enterprise issues.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2016	0.5	300	150
Email correspondence with Attorney Pector regarding waiver of service; send waivers of service.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2016	0.7	300	210
Meeting with Attorney Donahue re: Amended Complaint	Thomas Hallett	12/6/2016	0.3	300	90
Conversation with Attorney Hallett regarding amended complaint and service.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2016	0.3	300	90
Research personal jurisdiction issues	Ben Donahue	12/6/2016	0.5	300	150
Email correspondence with Attorney Pector regarding waiver of service.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2016	0.1	300	30
Meeting with Jon Hinck.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2016	1	300	300
Research regarding RICO issues related to potential amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/7/2016	2	300	600
ECF file proof of service on all defendants.	Athena Lavigne	12/8/2016	0.33	100	33
Research RICO issues; draft amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/13/2016	3.9	300	1170
Meeting with Attorney Donahue re: service	Thomas Hallett	12/14/2016	0.3	300	90
Discuss service issues with Attorney Hallett.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2016	0.3	300	90
Draft amended complaint; research regarding RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2016	4.5	300	1350

Research various RICO issues including enterprise and fraud issues; draft amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/16/2016	7.5	300	2250
Draft amended complaint; research regarding RICO causation issues.	Ben Donahue	12/16/2016	3.7	300	1110
Meeting with Ben Donahue. Editing form email to Electricity Maine customers.	Timothy E. Zerillo	12/16/2016	0.2	300	60
Research RICO conspiracy issues.	Ben Donahue	12/17/2016	1.3	300	390
Research RICO conspiracy issues; draft amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/18/2016	5.2	300	1560
Draft amended complaint; extensive regarding RICO issues including elements of pattern of racketeering and course of conduct issues..	Ben Donahue	12/19/2016	7.2	300	2160
Meeting with Ben Donahue regarding class member contact by Defendants.	Timothy E. Zerillo	12/19/2016	0.3	300	90
Finish drafting amended complaint incorporating TFH revisions; research RICO conspiracy issues.	Ben Donahue	12/20/2016	5.9	300	1770
Finalize and file amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/20/2016	1.8	300	540
Draft motion for relief regarding arbitration.	Ben Donahue	12/20/2016	4.3	300	1290
Review and revise Amended complaint; Meeting with Attorney Donahue regarding the same.	Thomas Hallett	12/20/2016	1.3	300	390
Drafted letter to opposing counsel. Called USDC regarding service. Emailed Attorney Donahue on same.	Andrew Ambrose	12/21/2016	0.2	100	20
Draft motion for emergency relief.	Ben Donahue	12/21/2016	2.1	300	630
Handling more email inquiries by Electricity Maine customers.	Timothy E. Zerillo	12/21/2016	0.2	300	60
Draft emergency motion for protective order; research emergency motion issues; communicate with potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	12/22/2016	8.5	300	2550
Research Protective Order motion.	Thomas Hallett	12/22/2016	1.3	300	390
Reviewing motion for emergency protective order.	Timothy E. Zerillo	12/22/2016	0.2	300	60
Downloaded filings, drafted letter to opposing counsel.	Andrew Ambrose	12/23/2016	0.3	100	30
Finish drafting motion for protective order; final edits and file motion for protective order.	Ben Donahue	12/23/2016	5.3	300	1590
Respond to inquiry from BDN reporter.	Ben Donahue	12/28/2016	0.5	300	150
Review emails regarding Defendants' local counsel.	Ben Donahue	12/29/2016	0.1	300	30
Research class-wide proof issues.	Ben Donahue	12/31/2016	2	300	600
Meeting with Bob Cummins regarding protective order.	Ben Donahue	1/2/2017	0.7	300	210

Multiple calls with court regarding scheduling; calls with potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2017	0.5	300	150
Telephone conversation with Attorney Hallett regarding emergency motion.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2017	0.3	300	90
Review multiple emails from Court regarding deadlines and briefing schedule.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2017	0.1	300	30
Telephone conversation with potential witness.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2017	0.3	300	90
Research regarding protective order issues.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2017	0.9	300	270
Downloaded filings, updated file for counsel. Drafted letter to Attorney Aromando, attached demand letter to Electricity Maine, LLC. Emailed letter to Attorney Aromando.	Andrew Ambrose	1/4/2017	0.3	100	30
Telephone conversation with Attorney Hallett regarding arbitration issues.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2017	0.3	300	90
Research protective order issues and draft letter to Attorney Aromondo.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2017	2	300	600
Revise letter to Attorney Aramondo.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2017	1.1	300	330
T/C w/ Attorney Aromando; T/C w/ Attorney Donahue; Meeting with Attorney Donahue; Letter to Attorney Aromando; Several drafts of letter; Meeting with Attorney Donahue.	Thomas Hallett	1/4/2017	1.3	300	390
Discuss motion for protective order issues with Attorney Hallett.	Ben Donahue	1/9/2017	0.9	300	270
Draft letter to Aromondo; research class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	1/9/2017	2.5	300	750
Meeting with Attorney Donahue. Review and sign letter to Attorney Aromando.	Thomas Hallett	1/9/2017	1.2	300	360
Emails with Attorney Cummins regarding motion for protective order.	Ben Donahue	1/10/2017	0.3	300	90
Research legal issues related to class member contact and Motion for Protective Order; TCs with witnesses; review related documents and Electricity Maine waivers.	Ben Donahue	1/10/2017	8.7	300	2610
Telephone conversation with Attorney Cummins regarding reply brief	Ben Donahue	1/11/2017	0.2	300	60
Research class member contact and draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	1/11/2017	5.7	300	1710
Review filings related to Motion for Protective order.	Thomas Hallett	1/11/2017	1.3	300	390
Draft protective order reply brief.	Ben Donahue	1/12/2017	9.3	300	2790
Review Memoranda; Meeting with Bob and Attorney Donahue; Meeting with Attorney Donahue re: Reply Memo.	Thomas Hallett	1/12/2017	1.8	300	540
Speak with potential witnesses; research arbitration issues; Rule 23(d) issues; draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	1/13/2017	11.2	300	3360



Review Reply re protective order and affidavit.	Timothy E. Zerillo	1/14/2017	0.1	300	30
Research potential witnesses from defendant's marketing department.	Ben Donahue	1/15/2017	0.9	300	270
Draft letter to client regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	1/16/2017	0.5	300	150
Review Defendant's request for a hearing.	Ben Donahue	1/17/2017	0.3	300	90
Discuss Defendants' request for a hearing with Attorney Cummins.	Ben Donahue	1/17/2017	0.4	300	120
Review Opposition to Emergency Motion and Request for Hearing. Review Response to Opposition.	Timothy E. Zerillo	1/17/2017	0.4	300	120
Witness investigation regarding Electricity Maine marketing department.	Ben Donahue	1/18/2017	1.2	300	360
Emails with expert witness; telephone conversation with document management service.	Ben Donahue	1/18/2017	0.5	300	150
Discussion with expert Rick Tabors regarding class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	1/19/2017	0.5	300	150
Meet with Attorney Cummins regarding class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	1/19/2017	1.2	300	360
Emails with Court and attorney Cummins regarding hearing.	Ben Donahue	1/20/2017	0.2	300	60
Begin outlining issues for protective order hearing.	Ben Donahue	1/20/2017	1.1	300	330
Letter to clients regarding status update on protective order.	Ben Donahue	1/20/2017	0.4	300	120
Finalize letter to clients regarding status.	Ben Donahue	1/22/2017	0.2	300	60
Drafted letter to clients. Downloaded attachments.	Andrew Ambrose	1/23/2017	0.2	100	20
Research class certification issues.	Thomas Hallett	1/23/2017	2	300	600
Meeting with Ben on litigation hold notice.	Timothy E. Zerillo	1/25/2017	0.1	300	30
Discuss expert and class certification issues with Attorney Hallett.	Ben Donahue	1/26/2017	0.5	300	150
Analyze data regarding potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	1/27/2017	0.5	300	150
Prepare for protective order hearing.	Ben Donahue	2/1/2017	5.5	300	1650
Meeting with Attorney Donahue. Prepare for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	2/1/2017	1.5	300	450
Research protective order issues; prepare for oral argument.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2017	3.9	300	1170
Prepare for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	2/2/2017	1.8	300	540
Draft memo to Attorney Hallett regarding issues for hearing; extensive research regarding Rule 23(d) issues.	Ben Donahue	2/3/2017	4.5	300	1350
Prepare for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	2/3/2017	2.5	300	750
Outline RICO issues in anticipation of motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/5/2017	1.5	300	450
Prepare for hearing.	Ben Donahue	2/6/2017	2.1	300	630

Review defendant's motion to dismiss; research initial issues.	Ben Donahue	2/6/2017	1	300	300
Prepare for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	2/6/2017	7.8	300	2340
Prepare for protective order hearing; review defendants' answers, motion to dismiss; research regarding opposition to motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2017	8.5	300	2550
Research regarding proposed order.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2017	0.7	300	210
Prepare for and argue Motion for Protective Order.	Thomas Hallett	2/7/2017	5.3	300	1590
Review Answer of Power Provider. Review Answer of Electricity Maine. Review Motion to Dismiss Electricity Maine. Meet with Ben Donahue. Meeting with Ben Donahue.	Timothy E. Zerillo	2/7/2017	1.1	300	330
Revise proposed Order	Ann Dickey	2/8/2017	0.5	100	50
Draft proposed order; emails with Attorney Hallett regarding proposed order; research relevant to motion to dismiss; begin drafting motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/8/2017	4.4	300	1320
Research regarding motion to dismiss and class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	2/9/2017	3.5	300	1050
Emails with Attorney Aromondo and call with Attorney Hallett regarding stipulation.	Ben Donahue	2/9/2017	0.4	300	120
Conference with Attorney Donahue regarding proposed order.	Thomas Hallett	2/9/2017	1.3	300	390
Draft and research opposition to motion to dismiss; meeting regarding discovery; draft memo regarding discovery.	Ben Donahue	2/10/2017	5.8	300	1740
Discovery/strategy meeting w/civil team.	David A. Weyrens	2/10/2017	1.5	300	450
Emails with Attorney Aromando; Meeting with Attorney Donahue; Meeting with Lexbe; Discovery meeting.	Thomas Hallett	2/10/2017	2.4	300	720
Meeting re Lexbe. Meeting with case lawyers re discovery plan/ideas.	Timothy E. Zerillo	2/10/2017	2	300	600
Finalize letter to clients	Ann Dickey	2/17/2017	0.25	100	25
Revise letter to client regarding status update.	Ben Donahue	2/17/2017	0.8	300	240
Research regarding motion to dismiss issues.	Ben Donahue	2/17/2017	2.5	300	750
Research and draft response to Motion to Dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/20/2017	7.2	300	2160
Draft opposition to Motion to Dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/21/2017	2.6	300	780
Research regarding pleading amendment issues.	Ben Donahue	2/21/2017	1.2	300	360
Research regarding notice pleading vs. 9(b) issues.	Ben Donahue	2/21/2017	3.4	300	1020
Research RICO accrual issues.	Ben Donahue	2/22/2017	2.4	300	720
Research RICO vicarious liability issues.	Ben Donahue	2/22/2017	2.4	300	720
Emails with client regarding renewal dates.	Ben Donahue	2/22/2017	0.1	300	30

Telephone conversation with Electricity Maine customer regarding renewal notices.	Ben Donahue	2/22/2017	0.4	300	120
Research regarding RICO 1962(d) liability.	Ben Donahue	2/23/2017	3.2	300	960
Research vicarious liability issues with RICO; draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/25/2017	3.2	300	960
Draft opposition to motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	2/26/2017	5.9	300	1770
Review Opposition to Motion to Dismiss; research cases.	Thomas Hallett	2/26/2017	1.2	300	360
Proofread opposition to Defendant's Motion to Dismiss	Ann Dickey	2/27/2017	0.5	100	50
Finalize Opposition to Motion to Dismiss; multiple rounds of drafts and revisions; research regarding predicate acts and 1962(d).	Ben Donahue	2/27/2017	3.3	300	990
Review opposition to motion to dismiss; Conf. w/BD	David A. Weyrens	2/27/2017	0.7	300	210
Meeting with Attorney Donahue re: Opposition to Motion to Dismiss.	Thomas Hallett	2/27/2017	0.5	300	150
Letter to new class representative; retainer agreement.	Ben Donahue	3/6/2017	1.8	300	540
Prepare letter with enclosure to Jason Stein, LAC	Ann Dickey	3/7/2017	0.5	100	50
Research discovery issues and the scope of class discovery.	Ben Donahue	3/9/2017	2.1	300	630
Conference with BND regarding Motion to Dismiss issues.	David A. Weyrens	3/9/2017	0.5	300	150
Meeting with Attorney Zerillo, Attorney Weyrens regarding case status.	Thomas Hallett	3/9/2017	0.5	300	150
Review Defendant's reply brief; discuss motion to strike issues with TFH.	Ben Donahue	3/13/2017	0.5	300	150
Review Reply to Response to Motion to Dismiss by Sparc HoldCo and Request for Hearing.	Timothy E. Zerillo	3/14/2017	0.3	300	90
Discuss discovery issues with Attorney Cummins.	Ben Donahue	3/16/2017	1	300	300
Setup discovery procedures within Lexbe.	Ben Donahue	3/17/2017	0.8	300	240
Draft written discovery.	Ben Donahue	3/21/2017	1	300	300
Document organization and planning.	Ben Donahue	3/22/2017	0.5	300	150
Review emails regarding collections issues.	Ben Donahue	3/22/2017	0.9	300	270
Telephone conversations with client and others regarding legislative issues.	Ben Donahue	3/23/2017	1.3	300	390
Draft motion joining Spark's request for oral argument.	Ben Donahue	3/24/2017	1.6	300	480
Telephone conversation with RBC regarding class action discovery issues; research discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	3/24/2017	1.9	300	570
Drafted Plaintiff's Joinder in Spark HoldCo LLC's Request for Hearing.	Andrew Ambrose	3/25/2017	0.3	100	30

Revise motion joining Sparks request for hearing.	Ben Donahue	3/26/2017	0.5	300	150
Respond to inquiry from Ben Murphy of Portland Press Herald regarding status of case.	Thomas Hallett	3/26/2017	0.5	300	150
Prepare status update from clients.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2017	2.5	300	750
Discussion with TEZ regarding putative class member communication; client communication.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2017	0.3	300	90
Review putative class member responses.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2017	0.9	300	270
Replying emails from Electricity Maine customers.	Timothy E. Zerillo	3/28/2017	0.7	300	210
Research electronic information gathering services; synthesize witness video clips.	Ben Donahue	3/29/2017	2.3	300	690
Research RICO debt collection issues.	Ben Donahue	3/29/2017	1.6	300	480
Outline key class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	3/30/2017	2.7	300	810
Review investigator reports; Electricity Maine materials gathered to date.	Ben Donahue	4/2/2017	2.6	300	780
Review emails from putative plaintiffs/Electricity Maine customers.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2017	0.3	300	90
Attention to file materials	Ann Dickey	4/10/2017	0.17	100	17
Discuss investigation issues with Private Investigator Joe Thorton; summarize witness information.	Ben Donahue	4/12/2017	0.9	300	270
Memo/email to joe thorton regarding witness issues.	Ben Donahue	4/13/2017	0.9	300	270
Emails with expert regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	4/20/2017	0.5	300	150
Prepare for telephone conversation with expert witness Rick Hornby; telephone conversation with Rick.	Ben Donahue	4/25/2017	1.5	300	450
Review complaint for declaratory judgment filed in insurance coverage matter.	Ben Donahue	5/3/2017	0.4	300	120
Emails with Attorney Whitman regarding DJ complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/5/2017	0.5	300	150
Emails with Whitman regarding acceptance of service.	Ben Donahue	5/15/2017	0.3	300	90
Initial coverage analysis regarding DJ issues.	Ben Donahue	5/15/2017	0.6	300	180
Research coverage issues.	Ben Donahue	5/17/2017	1	300	300
Review Zurich Insurance policy.	Ben Donahue	5/18/2017	0.9	300	270
Communications with Attorney Whitman.	Ben Donahue	5/19/2017	0.2	300	60
Additional research regarding coverage issues.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2017	1.2	300	360
Attention to file materials	Ann Dickey	5/25/2017	0.17	100	17
Draft answer to DJ complaint.	Ben Donahue	6/1/2017	0.5	300	150
Telephone conversation with court regarding electronic filing.	Ben Donahue	6/5/2017	0.2	300	60
Emails with opposing counsel regarding jurisdictional issues.	Ben Donahue	6/13/2017	0.3	300	90

Legal research regarding jurisdictional issues in class action insurance coverage action.	Ben Donahue	6/13/2017	1.2	300	360
Meeting with claims administrator.	Ben Donahue	6/14/2017	1.6	300	480
Research insurance coverage issues.	Ben Donahue	6/16/2017	1.3	300	390
Conversation with DF regarding case posture; legal research regarding agreed-to discovery before rule 26(f) conference.	Ben Donahue	6/20/2017	0.9	300	270
Telephone conversation with opposing counsel regarding dismissal of certain defendants without prejudice.	Ben Donahue	6/21/2017	0.5	300	150
Extensive research regarding insurance coverage issues.	Ben Donahue	6/21/2017	2.1	300	630
Telephone conversation and emails with opposing counsel regarding stipulation-of-dismissal issues.	Ben Donahue	6/22/2017	0.8	300	240
Research issues regarding amending complaint.	Ben Donahue	6/22/2017	1.3	300	390
Discussions with TFH regarding renewal notices.	Ben Donahue	6/30/2017	0.1	300	30
Review emails from client regarding renewal notices.	Ben Donahue	6/30/2017	0.5	300	150
Began drafting motion to amend and amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	6/30/2017	3.3	300	990
Communications with opposing counsel regarding filing amended complaint; research regarding insurance policy limits.	Ben Donahue	7/1/2017	1.5	300	450
Research issues relevant to amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	7/5/2017	4.3	300	1290
Draft motion to amend and research Rule 15 issues.	Ben Donahue	7/5/2017	3.4	300	1020
Finalize motion to amend and amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	7/6/2017	3.9	300	1170
Attention to electronic case filings	Ann Dickey	7/10/2017	0.5	100	50
Multiple emails with opposing counsel regarding briefing schedule.	Ben Donahue	7/10/2017	0.5	300	150
Letter to clients; research amendment/dismissal issues.	Ben Donahue	7/13/2017	1.4	300	420
Attention to electronic case filings; receive insurance policy from opposing counsel; process same	Ann Dickey	7/20/2017	1	100	100
Initial research regarding motion for summary judgment.	Ben Donahue	7/25/2017	3.5	300	1050
Review EM's motion to amend.	Ben Donahue	7/28/2017	0.3	300	90
Multiple emails with opposing counsel regarding briefing schedule.	Ben Donahue	7/31/2017	0.5	300	150
Begin drafting reply brief in support of motion to amend.	Ben Donahue	8/1/2017	2.7	300	810

Extensive legal research regarding reply brief issues.	Ben Donahue	8/3/2017	5.4	300	1620
Draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/4/2017	3.4	300	1020
Research regarding motion to dismiss issues, including UPTA issues and RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	8/7/2017	1.2	300	360
Draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/7/2017	8.3	300	2490
Continue drafting reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/8/2017	8.9	300	2670
Continue drafting reply brief; additional legal research regarding RICO conspiracy issues.	Ben Donahue	8/9/2017	8.4	300	2520
Draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/10/2017	1.2	300	360
Finalize and final reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/11/2017	6.2	300	1860
Email to client enclosing Reply Brief filed on her behalf	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/11/2017	0.08	100	8
Review defendants' insurances policies.	Ben Donahue	8/18/2017	0.4	300	120
Emails with clients regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	8/30/2017	0.3	300	90
Begin OA outline.	Ben Donahue	9/1/2017	1.2	300	360
Motion to Dismiss OA prep.	Ben Donahue	9/3/2017	3.1	300	930
Emails with Whitman regarding new amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	9/7/2017	0.2	300	60
Emails with Attorney Cummins regarding hearing.	Ben Donahue	9/7/2017	0.2	300	60
Emails with John Whitman regarding amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	9/8/2017	0.3	300	90
Begin preparing for oral argument.	Ben Donahue	9/8/2017	7.3	300	2190
Prepare for oral argument.	Ben Donahue	9/9/2017	4.3	300	1290
Prepare for oral argument; legal research regarding conspiracy issues.	Ben Donahue	9/10/2017	3.5	300	1050
Prepared Binder for Oral Argument.	Andrew Ambrose	9/11/2017	0.7	100	70
Prepare for and attend oral argument.	Ben Donahue	9/11/2017	6.2	300	1860
Begin researching supplemental brief issues.	Ben Donahue	9/12/2017	2.3	300	690
Draft letter to court regarding argument; discuss with DW.	Ben Donahue	9/13/2017	1.2	300	360
Review third amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	9/13/2017	0.3	300	90
Begin researching supplemental briefing issues.	Ben Donahue	9/19/2017	3.2	300	960
Research regarding supplemental briefing issues.	Ben Donahue	9/20/2017	1.2	300	360
Draft supplemental brief.	Ben Donahue	9/21/2017	7.9	300	2370
Research RICO conspiracy issues and draft supplemental brief.	Ben Donahue	9/22/2017	8.4	300	2520
Draft supplemental brief.	Ben Donahue	9/23/2017	2.1	300	630
Draft supplemental brief.	Ben Donahue	9/24/2017	1.4	300	420
Draft and file supplemental brief; extensive research and revisions.	Ben Donahue	9/25/2017	13.7	300	4110
Call with opposing counsel regarding Defendants' enlargement.	Ben Donahue	9/26/2017	0.2	300	60
Review new arguments raised by defendants.	Ben Donahue	9/27/2017	1.7	300	510

Telephone conversation with clerk regarding briefing schedule.	Ben Donahue	9/28/2017	0.3	300	90
Emails with opposing counsel regarding new briefing deadline.	Ben Donahue	9/28/2017	0.2	300	60
Review depositions; begin drafting statements of material facts.	Ben Donahue	9/28/2017	3.2	300	960
Draft supplemental brief.	Ben Donahue	10/6/2017	8.9	300	2670
Review insurance documents; multiple telephone conversations with opposing counsel regarding declaratory judgment.	Ben Donahue	10/20/2017	1.3	300	390
Telephone conversation with claims management specialist.	Ben Donahue	11/2/2017	0.4	300	120
Review court's order on Motion to Dismiss; discuss with TFH.	Ben Donahue	11/15/2017	1.1	300	330
Letter to clients regarding motion to dismiss.	Ben Donahue	11/16/2017	0.5	300	150
File amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	11/16/2017	0.7	300	210
accepted changes for amended complaint, with exhibits	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/16/2017	0.25	100	25
Review stipulated record after filing.	Ben Donahue	11/22/2017	1.2	300	360
TC with potential witness Elizabeth Seavey.	Ben Donahue	11/27/2017	0.2	300	60
Emails with PI regarding meeting; discuss discovery issues with TFH; review scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	11/28/2017	2	300	600
Email with private investigator regarding witness contact.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2017	0.3	300	90
Additional emails with private investigator regarding witness contact.	Ben Donahue	12/3/2017	0.2	300	60
Review scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	12/3/2017	0.3	300	90
Electricity Maine Discovery Meeting	Ben Donahue	12/3/2017	1.7	300	510
Email with co-counsel regarding discovery conference.	Ben Donahue	12/4/2017	0.2	300	60
Email with private investigator regarding witness contact.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2017	0.2	300	60
Draft memo to Dave Loranger regarding witnesses.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2017	1.8	300	540
Continue drafting memo to D. Loranger regarding investigation.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2017	1.9	300	570
Meeting with Attorney Cummins regarding discovery.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2017	1.5	300	450
discussion with BND.	Dan Feldman	12/5/2017	0.3	300	90
Meeting with BND, Robert Cummings.	Dan Feldman	12/5/2017	1.2	300	360
Formatted Memo.	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/5/2017	0.1	100	10
Formatted/made edits to memo	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/5/2017	0.4	100	40
Follow up emails with Attorney Cummins regarding discovery conference.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2017	0.4	300	120

Meeting with PI David Loranger regarding investigation into ex-employees.	Ben Donahue	12/7/2017	0.8	300	240
Emails with Attorney Cummins regarding investigation of Electricity Maine.	Ben Donahue	12/7/2017	0.4	300	120
Meeting with PI David Loranger.	Thomas Hallett	12/7/2017	0.75	300	225
Emails with Attorney Cummins regarding Court filings.	Ben Donahue	12/8/2017	0.2	300	60
Telephone conversation with D. Loranger regarding investigation.	Ben Donahue	12/8/2017	0.4	300	120
Meeting with Attorneys Donahue and Cummings re: arbitration, discovery and depositions.	Thomas Hallett	12/10/2017	1.2	300	360
TC with potential witness Elizabeth Seavey.	Ben Donahue	12/11/2017	0.6	300	180
Email regarding Electricity Maine Door-to-Door Sales.	Ben Donahue	12/11/2017	0.4	300	120
TC with Loranger regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	12/11/2017	0.3	300	90
Email with Attorney Cummins regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	12/11/2017	0.4	300	120
Research class cert issues and individual misrepresentation issues.	Ben Donahue	12/12/2017	1.2	300	360
Draft discovery plan and objection to scheduling order; prepare for meet and confer.	Ben Donahue	12/13/2017	3.4	300	1020
Meeting with Tom and Bob regarding discovery; meeting with Tom re: status of case.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2017	2.1	300	630
Draft certification discovery plan.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2017	4.2	300	1260
Prepare for meet and confer; research certification issues.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2017	2.1	300	630
Email with investigator regarding door-to-door issues.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2017	0.4	300	120
Mtg. with BD re: status of case, discuss scheduling issues; strategy; mtg BD and Bob Cummings re strategy; scheduling meeting with all counsel	Thomas Hallett	12/14/2017	2.1	300	630
Emails regarding case status with co-counsel.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	0.3	300	90
Draft subpoenas; discuss class certification issues with TFH; research class certification standards.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	2.1	300	630
TC with David Goldman regarding his case against Electricity Maine.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	0.3	300	90
Draft subpoena discovery requests.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	1.2	300	360
Draft subpoena for freedom logistics.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	0.2	300	60
Draft additional subpoena document requests.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	3.2	300	960
Continue to work on subpoena list and issues.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2017	2.3	300	690



Letter enclosing acceptance of service / subpoena	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/15/2017	0.3	100	30
review case law on class certification 2 first circuit cases, one s ct case.	Thomas Hallett	12/15/2017	2.75	300	825
research review; review 30(b)(6) notice; mtg w BD re initial disclosure and damage calculations.	Thomas Hallett	12/15/2017	2.75	300	825
Legal research and analysis regarding class cert. issues.	Ben Donahue	12/18/2017	4.2	300	1260
Emails with Attorney Cummins regarding subpoena on Freedom logistics.	Ben Donahue	12/18/2017	0.3	300	90
Discussion with BND regarding research.	Dan Feldman	12/18/2017	0.2	300	60
Revisions to scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	12/19/2017	0.5	300	150
Emails with opposing counsel re scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	12/19/2017	0.2	300	60
Call with Cummins	Ben Donahue	12/19/2017	0.4	300	120
Call with experts Tabors and Hornby.	Ben Donahue	12/19/2017	1.2	300	360
TCw/ experts, BD, and BC; mtg BD BC	Thomas Hallett	12/19/2017	1.2	300	360
Emails with opposing counsel and Attorney Cummins regarding scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	12/22/2017	0.5	300	150
Review filing - Court's original scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	12/22/2017	0.2	300	60
Draft proposed scheduling order; telephone conversations with Attorney Cummins regarding the same.	Ben Donahue	12/22/2017	1.2	300	360
Draft discovery requests; legal research regarding class certification issues; draft 30(b)(6) notice.	Ben Donahue	12/22/2017	2.5	300	750
Printed out all Archives from 2013-2015 on Provider Power webiste	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/27/2017	0.7	100	70
Emails with Dr. O'Brien re expert witness role.	Ben Donahue	12/28/2017	0.3	300	90
TC with potential expert.	Ben Donahue	12/28/2017	0.9	300	270
Emails with co-counsel regarding draft discovery.	Ben Donahue	1/1/2018	0.2	300	60
Research and outline class certification issues.	Ben Donahue	1/1/2018	1.2	300	360
Emails regarding proposed discovery.	Ben Donahue	1/2/2018	0.5	300	150
TC with Jason regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	1/2/2018	0.7	300	210
Draft deposition notice; extensive legal research regarding damages model.	Ben Donahue	1/2/2018	5.2	300	1560
Prepared Request for Production of Documents, Notice of Depo, and Request for Interrogatories	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/2/2018	0.5	100	50
Draft requests for production; additional research regarding damages data.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2018	2.5	300	750
Draft interrogatories	Ben Donahue	1/3/2018	1.5	300	450

Mtg w/ BND, research out of state subpoena issue, memo to file.	Dan Feldman	1/3/2018	2.8	300	840
Prepared subpoena for David Goldman	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/3/2018	0.2	100	20
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/4/2018	1	100	100
Discussion with DFF regarding subpoenas draft written discovery; research regarding damages modeling; continue outlining motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2018	0.4	300	120
Research issues at Attorney Donahue's direction.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2018	7.1	300	2130
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Dan Feldman	1/4/2018	1.2	300	360
TC with Rick Hornby regarding damages data.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/5/2018	1	100	100
Additional research at Attorney Donahue's direction.	Ben Donahue	1/5/2018	0.3	300	90
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Dan Feldman	1/5/2018	1.8	300	540
Draft discovery requests; subpoenas; and interrogatories.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/6/2018	0.5	100	50
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	1/6/2018	4.2	300	1260
Emails with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/7/2018	0.5	100	50
Re: draft discovery - revisions - move call time	Ben Donahue	1/7/2018	0.4	300	120
Draft additional subpoena document requests and revise interrogatories.	Ben Donahue	1/7/2018	0.2	300	60
Draft discovery; telephone calls with expert; telephone call with court; emails with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	1/7/2018	0.6	300	180
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	1/7/2018	3.6	300	1080
TC with Kathy Veilleux regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	1/7/2018	3.3	300	990
Draft subpoenas; depo notices; emails with attorney Cummins; telephone conversations with client; calls with potential witnesses.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/8/2018	0.6	100	60
Request for Interrogatories and notice of deposition	Ben Donahue	1/8/2018	0.7	300	210
Notice of Discovery Service with cover letter.	Ben Donahue	1/8/2018	6.5	300	1950
Subpoenas for CMP, SAGA, Townsquare, Calibus.	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/8/2018	0.5	100	50
Cover letters and Request for service to Sheriff's Office.	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/8/2018	0.7	100	70

Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/9/2018	0.5	100	50
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/10/2018	1	100	100
Revise subpoena document requests.	Ben Donahue	1/10/2018	1.3	300	390
Research and outline motion for class certification.	Ben Donahue	1/10/2018	5.2	300	1560
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.					
Editing spreadsheet for Class Action. Editing potential witness list.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/11/2018	2.2	100	220
TC with D. Loranger regarding investigation.	Ben Donahue	1/11/2018	1.1	300	330
Review and finalize subpoenas.	Ben Donahue	1/11/2018	1.2	300	360
Research causation issues as the impact class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/11/2018	3.3	300	990
Managing class action email account, and locating potential witnesses.					
Editing spreadsheet for Class Action. Editing potential witness list.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/12/2018	3	100	300
Draft initial disclosures.	Ben Donahue	1/14/2018	3.5	300	1050
Legal research regarding damages calculations; draft initial disclosures.	Ben Donahue	1/15/2018	6.5	300	1950
Edits Exhibit A. Emailed Plaintiff's Initial Disclosures and Exhibit A to counsel.	Andrew Ambrose	1/16/2018	0.2	100	20
Finalize initial disclosures.	Ben Donahue	1/16/2018	2.1	300	630
Prepare initial disclosures.	Ben Donahue	1/16/2018	6	300	1800
Review Defendants' discovery requests.	Ben Donahue	1/18/2018	0.5	300	150
TC with Portland Radio Group about subpoena.	Ben Donahue	1/19/2018	0.4	300	120
Emails regarding subpoena response.	Ben Donahue	1/22/2018	0.1	300	30
TC with Attorney Cummins regarding investigation	Ben Donahue	1/22/2018	0.3	300	90
Email with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	1/22/2018	0.1	300	30
Went to Portland Radio Group in SOPO to get audio file thumb drive	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/22/2018	0.4	100	40
Review PRG subpoena materials.	Ben Donahue	1/23/2018	1.5	300	450
TC with Rick Hornby.	Ben Donahue	1/23/2018	0.8	300	240
Emails regarding Electricity Maine scheduling call today.	Ben Donahue	1/24/2018	0.2	300	60
Compiling class action respondent information for David Loranger (PI). Emails to David.	Abigail J. Woodman	1/25/2018	1	100	100
Review expert models; defendants discovery requests.	Ben Donahue	1/25/2018	1.2	300	360
TC with client regarding production of documents.	Ben Donahue	1/25/2018	0.3	300	90

Emails with PI Dave Loranger. Re: Electricity Maine	Abigail J. Woodman	1/26/2018	0.4	100	40
Meeting with BND re: investigation; scope of work.	Ben Donahue	1/26/2018	0.1	300	30
Logged in to Maine Public Utilities Commission website. Downloaded filings under 2010-00256.	Thomas Hallett	1/26/2018	0.3	300	90
Received call from David Loranger, PI. met with Attorney Donahue. Emailed PI Loranger, emailed Ms. Woodman on same.	Andrew Ambrose	1/29/2018	1.3	100	130
TC with CMP general counsel.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	0.3	300	90
Emails with client regarding scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	0.2	300	60
Email with investigator regarding Ashley Rand Interview	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	0.1	300	30
Additional emails with private investigator regarding witness contact.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	0.5	300	150
Emails with co-counsel regardign subepona response.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	0.2	300	60
Research regarding class certification issues and RICO causation issues.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2018	2.4	300	720
Attempt to download contents of thumb drive, unsupported	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/31/2018	0.01	100	1
Review discovery issues in preparation for discovery conference.	Ben Donahue	2/1/2018	1.9	300	570
TC with opposing counsel regarding search terms.	Ben Donahue	2/1/2018	0.4	300	120
Research mitigation of damages issues.	Ben Donahue	2/1/2018	2.1	300	630
mtg BD re search terms for PA	Thomas Hallett	2/1/2018	0.5	300	150
Logged into Maine Public Utilities Commission, downloaded PUC filings from 2013-00200 and partially downloaded form 2014-00214	Andrew Ambrose	2/2/2018	0.8	100	80
Email with expert regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2018	0.1	300	30
Review PUC filings RE Electricity Maine.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2018	1.7	300	510
Emails with expert regarding clients' damages info.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2018	0.2	300	60
Legal research regarding search terms and stipulations.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2018	1.9	300	570
mtg BD re: mitigation defense re class certification	Thomas Hallett	2/2/2018	0.6	300	180
Emails with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding confidentiality order.	Ben Donahue	2/4/2018	0.6	300	180
Downloaded remainder of filings from Maine Public Utilities Commission. Upladed documents to file.	Andrew Ambrose	2/5/2018	0.5	100	50
TC with K. Kayatta.	Ben Donahue	2/6/2018	0.3	300	90

Draft discovery requests; deal with other discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	2/6/2018	2.3	300	690
TC with K. Veilleux.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2018	0.4	300	120
TC with Melissa Hewey.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2018	0.4	300	120
TC with D. Loranger.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2018	0.5	300	150
Document review; uploading; and processing.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2018	5.8	300	1740
TC with Attorney Donahue re: confidentiality.	Thomas Hallett	2/7/2018	0.4	300	120
Document review; document processing.	Ben Donahue	2/8/2018	3.2	300	960
Draft objections to Defendants' First RPD.	Ben Donahue	2/8/2018	5.3	300	1590
Made productions on Lexbe for Blueberry, PRG, Veilleux, Stein, and Chon	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/8/2018	0.3	100	30
Emails with co-counsel regarding Electricity Maine advertising materials.	Ben Donahue	2/9/2018	0.5	300	150
Emails with co-counsel regarding Electricity Maine PUC filings.	Ben Donahue	2/9/2018	0.2	300	60
Finalize objections to Defendants first RPD; create privilege log; review WP documents.	Ben Donahue	2/9/2018	2.9	300	870
Researching potential witnesses for P.I.	Abigail J. Woodman	2/12/2018	0.2	100	20
Hand delivered documents to Pierce Atwood	Andrew Ambrose	2/12/2018	0.4	100	40
Revise objections to Defendants' RPD after discussions with co-counsel.	Ben Donahue	2/12/2018	2	300	600
TC with Rick Tabors regarding scheduling; damages modeling.	Ben Donahue	2/13/2018	0.2	300	60
Begin drafting motion for class cert; extensive research regarding causation issues and class certification.	Ben Donahue	2/13/2018	6.3	300	1890
Class action email management. Search for appropriate respondents for PI Loranger.	Abigail J. Woodman	2/14/2018	1.5	100	150
Research and draft Motion for Class cert.	Ben Donahue	2/14/2018	7.2	300	2160
TC with opposing counsel regarding production to customers personal information.	Ben Donahue	2/14/2018	0.5	300	150
Conference with Attorney Donahue re: discovery issue.	Thomas Hallett	2/14/2018	0.5	300	150
Class action email management and search for appropriate respondents. Emails with Dave Loranger and Attorney Donahue. Draft list of potential witnesses for Loranger.	Abigail J. Woodman	2/15/2018	2.5	100	250
Prepared modified Word version to PDF of request to Judge Rich	Andrew Ambrose	2/15/2018	0.2	100	20
Letter to Judge Rich; continue researching class cert issues.	Ben Donahue	2/15/2018	3.5	300	1050
Continue drafting letter to Judge Rich regarding discovery dispute.	Ben Donahue	2/15/2018	0.2	300	60

Email to court with Local Rule 26(b) Letter.	Ben Donahue	2/15/2018	0.2	300	60
Compiling class action respondent information by geographic area. Drafting and emailing list to Dave Loranger and Attorney Donahue.	Abigail J. Woodman	2/16/2018	2	100	200
Uploaded documents to Lexbe.	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/16/2018	0.1	100	10
Document review of Defendants' First Production.	Ben Donahue	2/19/2018	4.7	300	1410
Email to clients regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	2/20/2018	0.5	300	150
Created/run production for Townsquare Media Documents	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/21/2018	0.5	100	50
Production of TSM, link, notice of discovery service and cover letter to counsel	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/22/2018	0.6	100	60
email to counsel enclosing second response to RPD	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/22/2018	0.3	100	30
Discussion with Dan regarding document review; document review.	Ben Donahue	2/23/2018	1.3	300	390
Emails with co-counsel regarding document production.	Ben Donahue	2/23/2018	0.1	300	30
Mtg w/ BND re: Lexbe, document review strategy.	Dan Feldman	2/23/2018	0.5	300	150
Meeting with RBC regarding discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	2/26/2018	1.2	300	360
Prepare for, and call with the court, regarding discovery.	Ben Donahue	2/26/2018	0.9	300	270
Draft Plaintiffs Second RPD.	Ben Donahue	2/26/2018	0.4	300	120
Plaintiffs Second RPD, Notice of Discovery, cover letter	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/26/2018	0.3	100	30
Draft motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	2/28/2018	1.3	300	390
Review and process spreadsheet data.	Ben Donahue	2/28/2018	4.2	300	1260
Emails with co-counsel and paralegal regarding Defendants' recent production.	Ben Donahue	3/1/2018	0.2	300	60
Draft new subpoena to Calibus.	Ben Donahue	3/1/2018	0.3	300	90
Re-mailed Subpoena to Calibus	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/1/2018	0.2	100	20
Review documents and draft interrogatory responses.	Ben Donahue	3/2/2018	3.2	300	960
Draft interrogatory responses.	Ben Donahue	3/4/2018	4.3	300	1290
Email with paralegal regarding discovery to-do.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2018	0.2	300	60
TC with expert regarding data received/data missing.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2018	0.6	300	180
Document review; process database information.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2018	2.3	300	690
Process document production.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2018	1.3	300	390
Emails with paralegal and expert regarding data transfer to their system.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2018	0.6	300	180

Draft memo to expert.	Ben Donahue	3/6/2018	2.8	300	840
TC with expert	Ben Donahue	3/6/2018	1.5	300	450
Letter and thumb drive to experts via Fed Ex	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/6/2018	0.4	100	40
Phone calls with Fed Ex attempting to get package to experts, email to experts updating them of status	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/6/2018	0.4	100	40
Email with expert regarding data delivery.	Ben Donahue	3/7/2018	0.1	300	30
TC with opposing counsel regarding discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	3/8/2018	0.5	300	150
Draft interrogatories.	Ben Donahue	3/9/2018	1	300	300
Additional memo to experts.	Ben Donahue	3/9/2018	0.9	300	270
Continue drafting memo to experts.	Ben Donahue	3/9/2018	3.5	300	1050
Emails with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/12/2018	0.3	300	90
TC with expert.	Ben Donahue	3/12/2018	0.4	300	120
Continue drafting memo to expert regarding causation.	Ben Donahue	3/12/2018	4.2	300	1260
TC with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/12/2018	0.3	300	90
Document review.	Dan Feldman	3/12/2018	3.4	300	1020
Motion to Amend Scheduling Order	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/12/2018	0.4	100	40
Email to opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/13/2018	0.5	300	150
Draft letter to clients regarding interrogatories; finish drafting interrogatories.	Ben Donahue	3/15/2018	2.3	300	690
Edits to client's interrogatories.	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/15/2018	0.4	100	40
Draft requests for admission.	Ben Donahue	3/16/2018	0.1	300	30
Emails with co-counsel and opposing counsel regarding depositions.	Ben Donahue	3/16/2018	0.5	300	150
Document review.	Dan Feldman	3/16/2018	2.9	300	870
Email to client enclosing answers and damages spreadsheet.	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/16/2018	0.3	100	30
Review all emails produced by CMP for evidence of fraud by defendants.	Thomas Hallett	3/16/2018	1.2	300	360
Review documents produced by CMP.	Thomas Hallett	3/16/2018	1.2	300	360
Draft memo to experts regarding client's damages.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	2.5	300	750
Emails with co-counsel regarding CMP response.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.3	300	90
Additional emails regarding depositions and scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.4	300	120
TC with CMP general counsel.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.1	300	30
Emails regarding Defendants' Amended Response to Interrogatories.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.2	300	60

Additional emails regarding depositions and scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.2	300	60
Email with opposing counsel regarding discovery items.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.2	300	60
Emails with clients regarding deposition scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.5	300	150
Email with opposing counsel regarding filing amended scheduling order.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.2	300	60
FW: Veilleux v. Electricity Maine: Defendants' Amended Response to Interrogatories	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.1	300	30
RE: Veilleux - Depositions	Ben Donahue	3/18/2018	0.1	300	30
Memo to expert regarding damages analysis.	Ben Donahue	3/19/2018	4.3	300	1290
TC with opposing counsel.	Ben Donahue	3/19/2018	0.4	300	120
TC with Lorganer	Ben Donahue	3/19/2018	0.4	300	120
Communications with Attorney Cummins; draft assumptions for experts.	Ben Donahue	3/19/2018	1.5	300	450
Emails with clients regarding deposition scheduling.	Ben Donahue	3/19/2018	0.5	300	150
Edits to Memo for Experts	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/19/2018	0.1	100	10
Email with Attorney Feldman regarding document review.	Ben Donahue	3/20/2018	0.5	300	150
attempt to continue document review on Lexbe website. Continuing difficulty with accessing documents. Unsuccessful attempts to resolve.					
Emails to/from Lexbe representative to resolve document review.	Dan Feldman	3/20/2018	0.6	300	180
	Dan Feldman	3/20/2018	1.3	300	390
Phone call and Email to experts rescheduling phone conference with TFH and BND	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/20/2018	0.3	100	30
document review.	Dan Feldman	3/21/2018	5.1	300	1530
Email to David Loranger enclosing CMP production	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/21/2018	0.1	100	10
document review.	Dan Feldman	3/22/2018	3.5	300	1050
Prepare for and TC with experts.	Ben Donahue	3/23/2018	2.9	300	870
Email with experts regarding data requirements	Ben Donahue	3/23/2018	0.1	300	30
document review.	Dan Feldman	3/23/2018	3	300	900
TC w/ expert; mtg with BND; review police reports re: Spark.	Thomas Hallett	3/23/2018	1.1	300	330
TC with Loranger regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	3/26/2018	0.6	300	180
TC regarding Veilleux/Electricity Maine Discovery Issues	Ben Donahue	3/26/2018	0.3	300	90
Draft memo regarding document review.	Ben Donahue	3/26/2018	1	300	300
phone call to client	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/26/2018	0.1	100	10



Notice of Discovery Service for Katherine Veilleux's answers to interrogatories and Production of Documents	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/26/2018	0.5	100	50
Went to Rocky Coast Acupuncture, notarized Jason Stein's Answers to Defendant's Request for Interrogatories.	Andrew Ambrose	3/27/2018	0.5	100	50
TC with D. Loranger.	Ben Donahue	3/27/2018	0.4	300	120
Document review.	Dan Feldman	3/27/2018	6.8	300	2040
Draft supplemental memo to experts.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2018	4.2	300	1260
Email with opposing counsel regarding discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2018	0.6	300	180
Initial review of defendants' 4th production.	Ben Donahue	3/28/2018	2.2	300	660
Produced Rocky Coast Acupuncture's answers to interrogatories	Kiersten Van Syckle	3/28/2018	0.2	100	20
Review emails from P.I. and TC with Loranger.	Thomas Hallett	3/28/2018	0.8	300	240
Meeting with BND - discuss amendments; new info from PI Loranger.	Thomas Hallett	3/28/2018	1.3	300	390
Meeting with TFH and RBC.	Ben Donahue	3/29/2018	1.3	300	390
Research regarding Spark and cases pending in other jurisdictions.	Ben Donahue	3/29/2018	1.7	300	510
Answer inquiries from Electricity Maine customers.	Ben Donahue	3/29/2018	0.7	300	210
Draft amended 30(b)(6) deposition notice.	Ben Donahue	4/2/2018	4.5	300	1350
Research regarding protective order limitations	Ben Donahue	4/2/2018	2.4	300	720
Emails with potential witnesses regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	4/2/2018	0.3	300	90
Emails with court reporter (Dennis Ford) regarding transcript needed. Specified 3 day turn around	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/2/2018	0.2	100	20
Continue drafting amended 30(b)(6) depo notice.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2018	1.7	300	510
Discussion with TFH regarding protective order.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2018	0.6	300	180
New Memo regarding door-to-door sales legal issues.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2018	2.2	300	660
Email regarding statistical damage issues with experts.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2018	0.5	300	150
Research Rule 23(d) issues and Defendants contact with class members.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2018	1.5	300	450
Document review	Dan Feldman	4/3/2018	1.5	300	450
Email statistic project (extracting data like how many emails sent and how many were read)	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/3/2018	1	100	100
Review 36(b)(6) notice	Thomas Hallett	4/3/2018	0.6	300	180
review transcript of fist hearing; conference with BD	Thomas Hallett	4/3/2018	0.9	300	270

Review statistical data compiled by experts.	Ben Donahue	4/4/2018	0.2	300	60
Finalize Amended Notice of Deposition.	Ben Donahue	4/4/2018	1.4	300	420
Emails with private investigator regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	4/4/2018	0.6	300	180
Amended Notice of Deposition with Notice of Discovery Service	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/4/2018	0.5	100	50
Amended Notice of Deposition and Notice of Discovery Service, CMP production zip folder - all emailed to Counsel	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/4/2018	0.3	100	30
Discussion with Elizabeth Seavey regarding her affidavit; prepare for meeting with witnesses.	Ben Donahue	4/5/2018	2.6	300	780
Review Loranger interview reports; discuss his affidavit.	Ben Donahue	4/5/2018	2.5	300	750
Travel to Bath with D. Loranger to meet with witness Elizabeth Seavey.	Ben Donahue	4/5/2018	3.8	300	1140
Discuss document production with client.	Ben Donahue	4/5/2018	0.2	300	60
Plaintiffs Answers to Defendants Interrogatories and Notice of Service - email to Counsel	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/5/2018	0.2	100	20
Draft motion for protective order regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	4/6/2018	2.5	300	750
document review	Dan Feldman	4/6/2018	2.4	300	720
tc w/ K. Kayatta re: discovery; emails w/BD; tcw/ BD lft msg; review RFP 9 and try to locate documents	Thomas Hallett	4/6/2018	0.9	300	270
Draft loranger aff; draft motion for protective order.	Ben Donahue	4/9/2018	4.5	300	1350
Document review and review Loranger reports.	Ben Donahue	4/9/2018	2	300	600
document review	Dan Feldman	4/9/2018	0.5	300	150
Drafted finalized FOIA request to Norway Police Department. Reviewed Google for Norway Police Department address. Reviewed LinkedIn account of Wyatt Struin. Emailed FOIA to David Loranger, PI.	Andrew Ambrose	4/10/2018	0.4	100	40
TC with D. Loranger.	Ben Donahue	4/10/2018	0.3	300	90
Draft motion for protective order.	Ben Donahue	4/10/2018	2.8	300	840
document review.	Dan Feldman	4/10/2018	3.5	300	1050
Formatted David Loranger affidavit	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/10/2018	0.1	100	10
Research regarding Rule 23(d), contact with class members and protective order.	Ben Donahue	4/11/2018	3.2	300	960
Numerous emails regarding scheduling call with other Plaintiffs' counsel involved with Spark.	Ben Donahue	4/12/2018	0.7	300	210
TC with potential witnesses re door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	4/12/2018	0.5	300	150

Emails with experts regarding consumer behavior literature in retail electricity markets; research the same.	Ben Donahue	4/12/2018	2.3	300	690
TC with experts.	Ben Donahue	4/13/2018	0.6	300	180
Draft motion for protective order; research regarding door-to-door sales regulations.	Ben Donahue	4/13/2018	6.2	300	1860
Document review; TC with Loranger regarding affidavit.	Ben Donahue	4/16/2018	3.2	300	960
Review academic literature; draft Motion for Protective Order.	Ben Donahue	4/17/2018	2.3	300	690
Document review.	Ben Donahue	4/17/2018	1.5	300	450
Emails with clients regarding supplemental document production.	Ben Donahue	4/18/2018	0.3	300	90
Research regarding consumer behavior theories and customer inertia.	Ben Donahue	4/18/2018	0.5	300	150
Email with opposing counsel regarding depositions.	Ben Donahue	4/18/2018	0.2	300	60
Email to David Loranger enclosing affidavit for review	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/18/2018	0.3	100	30
Notarized Declaration of David Loranger.	Andrew Ambrose	4/19/2018	0.1	100	10
TC with Katherine Kayatta.	Ben Donahue	4/19/2018	0.4	300	120
Research 23(d) issues; begin depo prep.	Ben Donahue	4/19/2018	8.6	300	2580
Cover letter to Mission Investigative Group, request for service, subpoena for Calibus and correspondence to attorney at Calibus - emailed all to Karen at Mission Investigative Group	Kiersten Van Syckle	4/19/2018	0.6	100	60
Depo prep; document review.	Ben Donahue	4/20/2018	7.2	300	2160
Depo prep; research RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	4/23/2018	8	300	2400
Tc with expert.	Ben Donahue	4/23/2018	0.4	300	120
Prepare for depo.	Ben Donahue	4/24/2018	8.2	300	2460
3 TC w/ Ben. Prepare for conference. Conference with Court.	Abigail J. Woodman	4/25/2018	3.75	100	375
Depo prep; prep and hearing on discovery dispute; literature analysis.	Ben Donahue	4/25/2018	9.3	300	2790
TC with hornby	Ben Donahue	4/25/2018	0.4	300	120
Hand delivered thumbdrive of documents to Attorney Cummins office.	Andrew Ambrose	4/26/2018	0.1	100	10
Depo prep, etc.	Ben Donahue	4/26/2018	8.5	300	2550
Depo prep.	Ben Donahue	4/27/2018	5.2	300	1560
Depo prep.	Ben Donahue	4/28/2018	6.2	300	1860
Prepare for PP depo; document review.	Ben Donahue	4/29/2018	7.2	300	2160
Prepare for and conduct deposition of Provider Power.	Ben Donahue	4/30/2018	10.2	300	3060
Attend deposition.	Thomas Hallett	4/30/2018	5	300	1500
Document review; discussions with TFH and RBC regarding upcoming depositions and pleadings; draft amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/1/2018	5.2	300	1560

Meeting with BND re: discovery needs; discussion of 4/30 depo; conference with experts.	Thomas Hallett	5/1/2018	1.1	300	330
Draft amended complaint; document review.	Ben Donahue	5/2/2018	3.6	300	1080
TC with Dave Loranger.	Ben Donahue	5/3/2018	0.3	300	90
Review PP depo transcript.	Ben Donahue	5/6/2018	1.2	300	360
Went to Norman Hanson & DeTroy received exhibits from Attorney Cummins. Prepared copies of exhibits.	Andrew Ambrose	5/7/2018	3	100	300
Email with witnesses regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	5/7/2018	0.5	300	150
Email with Loranger regarding statements and testimony.	Ben Donahue	5/7/2018	0.2	300	60
TC with witness	Ben Donahue	5/7/2018	0.3	300	90
review transcript; discovery dispute letter;	Ben Donahue	5/7/2018	9.5	300	2850
Found all referenced exhibits and prepared them for Chris to distribute for deposition exhibits in transcript	Kiersten Van Syckle	5/7/2018	0.4	100	40
TC with Loranger.	Ben Donahue	5/8/2018	0.4	300	120
Literature review.	Ben Donahue	5/8/2018	2.3	300	690
Ran production for Calibus documents, prepared Notification of Discovery service, emailed to all opposing counsel.	Kiersten Van Syckle	5/8/2018	0.4	100	40
Attend deposition of EM.	Ben Donahue	5/9/2018	7.4	300	2220
TC with Attorney Hewey.	Ben Donahue	5/9/2018	0.3	300	90
Document review and processing.	Ben Donahue	5/9/2018	1.2	300	360
TC with Lorganer.	Ben Donahue	5/10/2018	0.3	300	90
Draft Joint Motion to Amend Scheduling Order in word - circulated to all opposing counsel for changes/edits	Kiersten Van Syckle	5/11/2018	0.2	100	20
Email with opposing counsel regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	5/13/2018	0.1	300	30
Review draft expert report; lengthy TC with experts.	Ben Donahue	5/14/2018	4.7	300	1410
TC with Attorney Kayatta.	Ben Donahue	5/14/2018	0.3	300	90
TC with PI regarding door-to-door sales.	Ben Donahue	5/14/2018	0.3	300	90
Research consumer behavior issues; research causation models; draft memo regarding the same; Meeting with Attorney Hallett re: claims including RICO	Ben Donahue	5/15/2018	8.4	300	2520
Meeting with Ben; discussion of numerous topics incl. Rico claim etc.	Thomas Hallett	5/15/2018	1.5	300	450
Review revised expert report; research consumer behavior issues presented by experts; review defendants marketing data; emails with expert.	Ben Donahue	5/16/2018	3.5	300	1050

TC with experts regarding report; extensive research regarding regression analysis and related issues.	Ben Donahue	5/17/2018	8.5	300	2550
Review proposed revisions to expert report; emails with experts regarding changes; TC with experts; extensive research regarding causation issues and consumer behavior models.	Ben Donahue	5/18/2018	6.5	300	1950
Review emails; meeting with BND.	Thomas Hallett	5/18/2018	0.5	300	150
TC w/ Dave Loranger.	Thomas Hallett	5/18/2018	0.3	300	90
Begin drafting amended complaint; extensive research regarding door-to-door consumer protection issues.	Ben Donahue	5/20/2018	5.5	300	1650
Review further revisions to expert report; TC with economist in Florida; research regarding consumer production issues; memo to experts regarding legal issues.	Ben Donahue	5/21/2018	11.3	300	3390
TC w/ James Tilton re: lead plaintiff.	Thomas Hallett	5/21/2018	0.5	300	150
Memo to expert regarding report status.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2018	0.9	300	270
Review Dean aff; expert report.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2018	1.2	300	360
TC with Hornby.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2018	0.4	300	120
Draft amended Complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2018	4.8	300	1440
TC with Tilton.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2018	0.2	300	60
Research regarding subclass issues.	Ben Donahue	5/23/2018	3	300	900
Expert report; draft amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/23/2018	6.2	300	1860
Draft amended complaint; extensive research regarding class certification and individual causation issues.	Ben Donahue	5/24/2018	8.3	300	2490
Meeting w/ Ben re: additional defendant; depo of Sparks/Texas.	Thomas Hallett	5/24/2018	0.8	300	240
Draft amended complaint; research regarding damages models and subclasses.	Ben Donahue	5/25/2018	9.4	300	2820
Draft amended complaint; research regarding consumer protection statutes and class certification.	Ben Donahue	5/26/2018	6.1	300	1830
Draft amended complaint; research regarding common proof and class certification.	Ben Donahue	5/27/2018	7.3	300	2190
Draft motion to amend complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/27/2018	4.2	300	1260
Review next round of revisions to expert report; research regarding scholarly research cited by experts; revise amended complaint. motion to amend.	Ben Donahue	5/28/2018	6	300	1800
Met with PI David Loranger, notarized Affidavit of David Loranger.	Andrew Ambrose	5/29/2018	0.2	100	20
Research regarding Daubert issues and regression models; draft amended complaint and motion to amend.	Ben Donahue	5/29/2018	7.5	300	2250
TC with Hornby.	Ben Donahue	5/29/2018	0.4	300	120

Used PACER to Find Cases and Create String Citation for the Third Amended Class Action Complaint and Jury Trial Demand	Dan Feldman	5/29/2018	3	300	900
Work on report with experts; discuss expert issues with TFH; research expert issues.	Ben Donahue	5/30/2018	3.4	300	1020
TC with witness.	Ben Donahue	5/31/2018	0.3	300	90
TC with reporter following inquiry.	Ben Donahue	5/31/2018	0.4	300	120
Review final round of revisions to expert report; finalize amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	5/31/2018	7.3	300	2190
Finalize expert report with experts.	Ben Donahue	6/1/2018	5.2	300	1560
Finalized letter to William Fessenden.					
Prepared zip drive for mailing.	Andrew Ambrose	6/4/2018	0.2	100	20
Draft letter to W. Fessenden.	Ben Donahue	6/4/2018	0.5	300	150
Discovery review.	Ben Donahue	6/4/2018	4.2	300	1260
Discuss discovery issues with RC; draft document review memo.	Ben Donahue	6/5/2018	3.1	300	930
	Kiersten Van Syckle				
Called Fessenden and left vm		6/7/2018	0.01	100	1
TC with Will F.	Ben Donahue	6/11/2018	0.4	300	120
Depo prep; document review; Meeting with Attorney Hallett re: discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	6/11/2018	6	300	1800
mtg w/ Ben re: discovery	Thomas Hallett	6/11/2018	0.9	300	270
Prepare for and conduct Fessenden depo.	Ben Donahue	6/12/2018	5.3	300	1590
Attended Deposition with BD	Dan Feldman	6/12/2018	2	300	600
mtg w/ Ben discuss depo	Thomas Hallett	6/12/2018	0.3	300	90
Draft discovery requests.	Ben Donahue	6/13/2018	4.2	300	1260
Discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	6/14/2018	4.5	300	1350
Familiarized with Case and Prepared for Document Review Meeting	Dan Feldman	6/14/2018	3	300	900
PUC Case Research	Dan Feldman	6/14/2018	2	300	600
PUC Case Research	Dan Feldman	6/15/2018	1	300	300
Meeting for Document Review Plan with BD	Dan Feldman	6/15/2018	1.5	300	450
Document review; depo prep.	Ben Donahue	6/18/2018	8.5	300	2550
PUC Case Research (Door to Door Sales)	Dan Feldman	6/19/2018	1.5	300	450
Witness prep for Chon depo.	Ben Donahue	6/20/2018	5.4	300	1620
Draft discovery; meet with J. Stein for depo prep.; Meeting with Attorney Hallett re: statutes pertaining to door to door sales	Ben Donahue	6/21/2018	5.25	300	1575
Meeting w/ BND re: statutes.	Thomas Hallett	6/21/2018	0.75	300	225
Finalize written discovery; emails to opposing counsel.	Ben Donahue	6/22/2018	2.2	300	660
Review of PUC Docket 2010-00256	Dan Feldman	6/22/2018	1	300	300
Meeting w/ Ben; review discovery requests - revise.	Thomas Hallett	6/22/2018	1.2	300	360
TC w/ Bob Cummins re: Texas def.	Thomas Hallett	6/29/2018	0.4	300	120
TC with opposing counsel regarding depositions.	Ben Donahue	7/2/2018	0.4	300	120

Research and reviewing all pleadings. Motion to Amend.	Thomas Hallett	7/3/2018	4.75	300	1425
Amended Subpoenas to D2D and AGD with attachments. Sent to all counsel.	Kiersten Van Syckle	7/6/2018	0.2	100	20
Document Review/Read through PUC Proceedings and Saving to OneNote	Dan Feldman	7/9/2018	1	300	300
Review Expert Report. Meet with BND.	Thomas Hallett	7/9/2018	8.2	300	2460
Sorting through PUC Proceedings	Dan Feldman	7/10/2018	1	300	300
Research Spark in other states. Review discovery docs.	Thomas Hallett	7/10/2018	2.75	300	825
Read through PUC Proceedings - Saved to OneNote	Dan Feldman	7/11/2018	0.5	300	150
Meeting and research regarding discovery; memo to clients regarding depo prep.	Ben Donahue	7/12/2018	3.4	300	1020
Attended Discovery Meeting with TH & BD	Dan Feldman	7/12/2018	1.5	300	450
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/12/2018	3.5	300	1050
Meeting w/ BD, BC, JR, Nate: re: discovery etc. TFH to prepare motion to strike; review doc's.	Thomas Hallett	7/12/2018	1.2	300	360
Research. Motion to Dismiss.	Thomas Hallett	7/12/2018	2.25	300	675
Draft memo regarding depositions; travel to Augusta and meet with K. Veilleux regarding depo.	Ben Donahue	7/13/2018	7.2	300	2160
TC with S Murphy.	Ben Donahue	7/13/2018	0.8	300	240
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/13/2018	2.5	300	750
Meeting w/ BD; TC w/ BD; research motion to strike.	Thomas Hallett	7/13/2018	1.75	300	525
Prepare for and attend Jason Stein's deposition.	Ben Donahue	7/16/2018	5.4	300	1620
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/16/2018	0.5	300	150
Research motion to strike issue.	Thomas Hallett	7/16/2018	4.25	300	1275
prepare for and attend depo of Jenny Chon.	Ben Donahue	7/17/2018	4.2	300	1260
TC with other spark involved lawyers.	Ben Donahue	7/17/2018	0.7	300	210
Meeting w/ BD; TC w/ Bob; TC w/ Chicago lawyers suing Spark.	Thomas Hallett	7/17/2018	1.2	300	360
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/18/2018	6	300	1800
Drafting motion to strike; research the same.	Thomas Hallett	7/18/2018	1.75	300	525
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/19/2018	2	300	600
Attend deposition of Katherine Veilleux.	Ben Donahue	7/20/2018	5.6	300	1680
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/20/2018	4.5	300	1350
Draft motion to strike; conference w/ experts.	Thomas Hallett	7/20/2018	4	300	1200
Draft and research opposition to motion for judgment.	Ben Donahue	7/23/2018	6.5	300	1950
Conducted RICO Legislative History Research	Dan Feldman	7/23/2018	3	300	900
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/23/2018	3	300	900
Research opp to MFJ.	Ben Donahue	7/24/2018	6	300	1800
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/24/2018	2	300	600

Draft; tc with experts; tc with Dr. O'Brien; research; meeting with TFH.	Ben Donahue	7/25/2018	9.2	300	2760
Draft opposition.	Ben Donahue	7/26/2018	1.4	300	420
RICO Research	Dan Feldman	7/26/2018	1	300	300
Drafted Tilton Declaration	Dan Feldman	7/26/2018	1	300	300
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/26/2018	1.5	300	450
Final draft motion to strike; emails and 2 telephone calls w/ Bob Cummins; review PUC - show cause order.	Thomas Hallett	7/26/2018	5.7	300	1710
Draft opposition.	Ben Donahue	7/27/2018	6.5	300	1950
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/27/2018	1.5	300	450
PUC Renewal Requirements Research	Dan Feldman	7/27/2018	2	300	600
Meeting w/ BD re: Motion to Strike; PUC issues; final review and filing of Motion to Strike.	Thomas Hallett	7/27/2018	1.8	300	540
Draft and research opposition.	Ben Donahue	7/29/2018	1.5	300	450
Draft opposition; telephone conversation with Dr. O'Brien.	Ben Donahue	7/30/2018	6.5	300	1950
Finished PUC Renewal Research	Dan Feldman	7/30/2018	1.5	300	450
Prepare for experts.	Thomas Hallett	7/30/2018	1.25	300	375
draft response; prepare for depotion of TCR.	Ben Donahue	7/31/2018	8.5	300	2550
Document Review	Dan Feldman	7/31/2018	1.5	300	450
Prepare for expert depo; mtg w/ BD. Mtg w/ experts.	Thomas Hallett	7/31/2018	1.75	300	525
Prepare for and attend TCR deposition.	Ben Donahue	8/1/2018	9	300	2700
Met with Maine Law School Librarian to Research Legislative History of RICO	Dan Feldman	8/1/2018	2.5	300	750
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/1/2018	0.75	300	225
Attend depos. TC w/ BD; meeting w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	8/1/2018	3.75	300	1125
Draft opposition to motion for judgment; reply to motion to strike.	Ben Donahue	8/2/2018	6.5	300	1950
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/2/2018	1.75	300	525
Draft opposition and reply.	Ben Donahue	8/3/2018	7.4	300	2220
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/3/2018	3	300	900
Research on Unfair Trade Practices	Dan Feldman	8/3/2018	1	300	300
Draft opposition to motion for judgement.	Ben Donahue	8/4/2018	3.7	300	1110
Draft opposition to motion for judgement.	Ben Donahue	8/5/2018	3.5	300	1050
Draft and finalize Response to MJF and Reply re Motion to Amend; extensive legal research regarding RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	8/6/2018	18	300	5400
sent to US Legal 8/3.					
8/6 spoke with Melody and explained to her that we need individual seperate certified transcriptions of each file - labeled by Bates Number (file name) and the file date.	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/6/2018	0.6	100	60
Telephone calls with Transcription Companies for video/audio advertisements	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/6/2018	0.8	100	80



Draft Opposition to M. Judgment on Pleading and research on same.	Thomas Hallett	8/6/2018	8.25	300	2475
Review Defendants' expert report and call with Tabors et al.	Ben Donahue	8/7/2018	1.9	300	570
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/7/2018	2.5	300	750
TC w/ Bob and Ben; strategize on issues re: discovery, "door to door," Sparks and review depo Sandra Nadeau.	Thomas Hallett	8/7/2018	1.4	300	420
Discovery issues; conversations with TFH; depo review.	Ben Donahue	8/8/2018	8.5	300	2550
RICO Legislative History Research	Dan Feldman	8/8/2018	1	300	300
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/8/2018	3.5	300	1050
Conference w/ BD and Bob Cummins.	Thomas Hallett	8/8/2018	1.2	300	360
Mtg w/ BD re: conference call.	Thomas Hallett	8/8/2018	0.4	300	120
Formatted letter to Magistrate Judge Rich. Emailed to Attorney Donahue	Andrew Ambrose	8/9/2018	0.2	100	20
Draft Motion to Amend; letter to court.	Ben Donahue	8/9/2018	3.5	300	1050
RICO Legislative History	Dan Feldman	8/9/2018	1	300	300
Document Review.	Dan Feldman	8/9/2018	0.75	300	225
Document Review.	Dan Feldman	8/10/2018	1.25	300	375
Research expert issues.	Ben Donahue	8/13/2018	2.5	300	750
Research regarding rebuttal issues.	Ben Donahue	8/13/2018	1.4	300	420
Review expert materials; begin prep for Goldberg deposition.	Ben Donahue	8/14/2018	5.4	300	1620
Multiple telephone conversations with experts; opposing counsel regarding depositions and deposition prep.	Ben Donahue	8/14/2018	1.5	300	450
Finalized Notice of Deposition to Richard Goldberg - sent to opposing counsel via email	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/14/2018	0.3	100	30
Prepare for Goldberg depo; deal with expert issues.	Ben Donahue	8/15/2018	8.5	300	2550
Emailed opposing counsel Amended Notice of Deposition of Richard Goldberg	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/15/2018	0.2	100	20
Call with Mike at Varallo Group LLC to schedule court reporter for Goldberg deposition. Emailed Amended Notice of Depo.	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/15/2018	0.5	100	50
Expert issues; prepare for Goldberg depo.	Ben Donahue	8/16/2018	9.4	300	2820
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/16/2018	0.5	300	150
Review expert issues; prepare for Goldberg depo.	Ben Donahue	8/17/2018	8.5	300	2550
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/17/2018	0.75	300	225
Draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	8/18/2018	3.4	300	1020
Finalize and file reply brief in support of Motion to Amend.	Ben Donahue	8/19/2018	2.1	300	630
Meet with BD; go over Reply memo.	Thomas Hallett	8/19/2018	0.8	300	240
Prepare for Goldberg depo; prepare for and attend telephonic hearing.	Ben Donahue	8/20/2018	8.5	300	2550

Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/20/2018	0.75	300	225
Emails with Varallo Group LLC to confirm court reporter will be at Dr. Goldberg's deposition	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/20/2018	0.2	100	20
Email to all counsel enclosing Uber Conference phone number and pin for the Motion to Amend Scheduling Order Hearing	Kiersten Van Syckle	8/20/2018	0.2	100	20
Prepare for hearing with Judge; attend hearing.	Thomas Hallett	8/20/2018	1.75	300	525
Goldberg depo prep	Ben Donahue	8/21/2018	9.2	300	2760
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/21/2018	2	300	600
TC w/ court re: Rebuttal and supplement. Prepare for hearing; mtg w/ BND.	Thomas Hallett	8/21/2018	2.55	300	765
Travel to and attend deposition of Dr. Richard Goldberg	Ben Donahue	8/22/2018	7.9	300	2370
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/22/2018	1.5	300	450
Meeting with Ben to discuss depo.	Thomas Hallett	8/22/2018	0.5	300	150
Document Review	Dan Feldman	8/23/2018	0.5	300	150
Meet w/ Ben re: depo of Goldberg and rebuttal. Telephone call w/ Chris Auger re: getting doc's to EM - take phone call w/ tele company.	Thomas Hallett	8/23/2018	1	300	300
TC with richard.	Ben Donahue	8/27/2018	0.4	300	120
Memo to experts regarding rebuttal report.	Ben Donahue	8/27/2018	2.4	300	720
Conversation with TFH regarding experts.	Ben Donahue	8/28/2018	0.4	300	120
Review draft expert opinion; draft memo to experts.	Ben Donahue	8/29/2018	1.2	300	360
Memo to experts regarding rebuttal report.	Ben Donahue	8/30/2018	2.8	300	840
Draft discovery; research motion to strike issues.	Ben Donahue	8/30/2018	6	300	1800
Draft reply brief in support of motion to strike.	Ben Donahue	8/31/2018	8.5	300	2550
Edit and revise rebuttal report with tabors.	Ben Donahue	9/3/2018	3.9	300	1170
Review report; TC w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	9/3/2018	1.2	300	360
Brief memo to expert regarding report.	Ben Donahue	9/4/2018	0.9	300	270
Expert issues.	Ben Donahue	9/4/2018	1.5	300	450
Revise expert rebuttal report.	Ben Donahue	9/5/2018	5	300	1500
Additional expert issues; revise and discuss rebuttal report.	Ben Donahue	9/5/2018	3.4	300	1020
Discovery issues.	Ben Donahue	9/6/2018	1.5	300	450
Review supp. report - expert; meet w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	9/6/2018	1.7	300	510
TC with Hewey.	Ben Donahue	9/10/2018	0.4	300	120
Travel to/from Rocky Coast Acupuncture to get client signature on interrogatories.	Athena Lavigne	9/12/2018	0.6	100	60
Emailed all counsel errata sheets for clients and experts	Kiersten Van Syckle	9/14/2018	0.1	100	10
Initial disclosures.	Ben Donahue	9/19/2018	0.9	300	270

Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: Re: Veilleux Update	Ben Donahue	10/1/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: Re: Veilleux Update	Ben Donahue	10/1/2018	0.2	300	60
Motion to extend.	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	1.2	300	360
Email re motion to enlarge.	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	0.1	300	30
Motion to extend.	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	0.3	300	90
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: RE: Activity in Case 1:16-cv-00571-NT VEILLEUX et al v. ELECTRICITY MAINE LLC et al Motion to Extend Time	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Tricia King re: Veilleux, et al v. Electricity Maine, LLC, et al	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: RE: Activity in Case 1:16-cv-00571-NT VEILLEUX et al v. ELECTRICITY MAINE LLC et al Motion to Extend Time	Ben Donahue	10/9/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Robert P. Cummins re: RE: Activity in Case 1:16-cv-00571-NT VEILLEUX et al v. ELECTRICITY MAINE LLC et al Motion to Extend Time	Ben Donahue	10/11/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Robert P. Cummins re: FW: Activity in Case 1:16-cv-00571-NT VEILLEUX et al v. ELECTRICITY MAINE LLC et al Motion to Extend Time	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Katherine S. Kayatta re: RE: Opposition to Motion to Strike	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Melissa A. Hewey re: RE: Opposition to Motion to Strike	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Tricia King re: Veilleux, et al v. Electricity Maine, LLC, et al	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: Re: Veilleux Update	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: RE: Veilleux, et al v. Electricity Maine, LLC, et al	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Rick Hornby re: RE: Veilleux, et al v. Electricity Maine, LLC, et al	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.2	300	60

Email Correspondence from Nathan Greene re: Veilleux Update	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	0.2	300	60
Draft response to motion to strike; research related issues.	Ben Donahue	10/15/2018	6	300	1800
Draft response to motion to strike.	Ben Donahue	10/17/2018	10.2	300	3060
Draft and file response to motion to strike.	Ben Donahue	10/19/2018	13.3	300	3990
Email Correspondence from Malina E. Dumas re: RE: Plumbers & Pipefitters Local 572 Pension Fund v. Cisco Systems, Inc	Ben Donahue	10/24/2018	0.2	300	60
Emails w/ court; emails w/ Bob Cummins; 2 TC w/ Bob; mtg w/ BD re: fraud hrg.	Thomas Hallett	11/2/2018	1.1	300	330
Numerous emails with RPC regarding Depos and conference with Court.	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.7	300	210
Numerous emails with counsel and the court regarding scheduling.	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.5	300	150
Email with client regarding case status.	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.2	300	60
Email Correspondence from Katherine S. Kayatta re: Automatic reply: Plumbers & Pipefitters Local 572 Pension Fund v. Cisco Systems, Inc	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: Plumbers & Pipefitters Local 572 Pension Fund v. Cisco Systems, Inc	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: FW: HWW-Vista Invoice 8-6-2018.pdf	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.1	300	30
Email Correspondence from Benjamin Donahue re: 10/11 (Veilleux) Response to Motion to Strike Rebuttal Report DUE	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.1	300	30
Telephone conf w/ Attorney Hallett; Emails with Attorney Hallett	Ben Donahue	11/5/2018	0.8	300	240
TC w/ BD; emails w/ BD, court and Cummins.	Thomas Hallett	11/5/2018	0.8	300	240
Meeting with TFH and RBC regarding arbitration hearing.	Ben Donahue	11/6/2018	1.2	300	360
Bob Cummins re: travel and hearing.	Thomas Hallett	11/6/2018	1.2	300	360
Call with James Tilton to get his availability for the next two months in the event a Evidentiary Hearing is scheduled	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/7/2018	0.2	100	20
Prepare for and meet with Judge Torresson.	Ben Donahue	11/9/2018	4.3	300	1290
Prepare for and attend conference.	Thomas Hallett	11/9/2018	3.2	300	960
Prepare discovery dispute materials.	Ben Donahue	11/12/2018	3.5	300	1050
TC to John Aromando - left msg; emails to court.	Thomas Hallett	11/12/2018	0.3	300	90
Mtg w/ BD; TC w/ Aromando; Emails w/ Cummins.	Thomas Hallett	11/12/2018	1.3	300	390
Draft 12(f) package.	Ben Donahue	11/15/2018	2.3	300	690
TC with Loranger.	Ben Donahue	11/19/2018	0.3	300	90

Witness wrangling and interviews; document review.	Ben Donahue	11/19/2018	6.4	300	1920
Final edits to Request for Hearing description letter. Filed request form and all 4 attachments via ECF	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/19/2018	0.8	100	80
Legal research regarding agency issues; admissibility issues; draft memo.	Ben Donahue	11/27/2018	6.1	300	1830
Prepare for and participate in telephonic hearing regarding discovery dispute; meet with RBC regarding witness prep; subpoenas; conversations with witnesses.	Ben Donahue	11/28/2018	7.3	300	2190
Conferences w/ Ben D.	Thomas Hallett	11/28/2018	0.6	300	180
Travel to and meet with client and witnesses.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2018	6.2	300	1860
Discuss trial prep issues with RBC.	Ben Donahue	11/29/2018	2.1	300	630
TC with counsel for Calibrus; Meeting with Attorney Hallett re: witnesses and hearing issues	Ben Donahue	11/30/2018	1.4	300	420
Prepare exhibits; research Evidence rule 902 issues.	Ben Donahue	11/30/2018	5.2	300	1560
9/13 emailed Kayla 10/1 emailed Kayla and copied Transcription Outsourcing 11/30 Received transcripts, email went to 'other' folder	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/30/2018	0.6	100	60
Call with Kevin to make sessions appointment. 12/6 @ 3pm	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/30/2018	0.6	100	60
Created/ran/downloaded Production of Tilton CMP bills - 000001-000041. Produced to OC via email with Lexbe Link	Kiersten Van Syckle	11/30/2018	0.6	100	60
Mtg w/ BD re: witness interviews; stipulation issues; hearing planning.	Thomas Hallett	11/30/2018	1	300	300
Prepare for 12-18 hearing.	Thomas Hallett	12/2/2018	4	300	1200
Document review	Ben Donahue	12/3/2018	4.5	300	1350
Research arbitration contract issues.	Ben Donahue	12/3/2018	4.5	300	1350
Formatted	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/3/2018	0.2	100	20
Prep for hearing. Mtg w/ BD and Bob C. TC w/ opposing counsel.	Thomas Hallett	12/3/2018	4.25	300	1275
Meet with bob and Tom regarding evidence issues.	Ben Donahue	12/4/2018	4.5	300	1350
Prepare exhibits; document review.	Ben Donahue	12/4/2018	5.4	300	1620
Mtg w/ BD and Bob C. Summarize Nadeau depo. Review and revise exhibit list. Review PUC documents in prep for 12/18 hearing.	Thomas Hallett	12/4/2018	6	300	1800
Exhibit issues; research rescission issues.	Ben Donahue	12/5/2018	3	300	900
Hearing prep - evidentiary issues. Points for Nadeau.	Thomas Hallett	12/5/2018	6.25	300	1875

Strategy regarding potential witnesses; review defendants exhibits and PI reports; research regarding contract issues.	Ben Donahue	12/6/2018	2	300	600
voicemail to Kevin at District Court re: technology session this afternoon. Let him know that we would have a ipad to bring with us instead of laptop	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/6/2018	0.1	100	10
Prepare for hearing. Review and revise exhibits. TC w/ opposing counsel.	Thomas Hallett	12/6/2018	5.75	300	1725
Research regarding contract formation issues.	Ben Donahue	12/7/2018	1.2	300	360
Draft trial brief; opposition to motion to dismiss on arbitration grounds.	Ben Donahue	12/7/2018	3.2	300	960
Prepare for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	12/7/2018	6.2	300	1860
Hearing prep.	Thomas Hallett	12/8/2018	1.75	300	525
Draft pre trial memo.	Ben Donahue	12/9/2018	4.5	300	1350
Prep for hearing.	Thomas Hallett	12/9/2018	2	300	600
Trial prep; trial brief.	Ben Donahue	12/10/2018	8.3	300	2490
Hearing prep; meeting with TFH and RBC.	Ben Donahue	12/11/2018	6.9	300	2070
Trial prep.	Thomas Hallett	12/11/2018	6.2	300	1860
Draft pretrial motions; trial brief.	Ben Donahue	12/12/2018	16.1	300	4830
Prep for trial.	Thomas Hallett	12/12/2018	8.3	300	2490
Pretrial motions; trial brief.	Ben Donahue	12/13/2018	17.3	300	5190
Trial prep.	Thomas Hallett	12/13/2018	5.25	300	1575
Travel and meet with client and witness; trial prep.	Ben Donahue	12/14/2018	10.4	300	3120
Trial prep.	Thomas Hallett	12/14/2018	4.7	300	1410
Trial prep.	Ben Donahue	12/15/2018	4.2	300	1260
Draft opposition to motion in limine.	Ben Donahue	12/16/2018	8.2	300	2460
Trial prep; mtg w/ Ben and Bob.	Thomas Hallett	12/16/2018	7	300	2100
Trial prep. Mtg w/ BD and BC.	Thomas Hallett	12/16/2018	7	300	2100
Trial prep.	Ben Donahue	12/17/2018	12.2	300	3660
Trial prep; prepare for cross examination of witnesses; review FRE; review exhibits.	Thomas Hallett	12/17/2018	7.25	300	2175
Prepare for and attend hearing on motion to amend.	Ben Donahue	12/18/2018	6.9	300	2070
Debrief with client following hearing.	Ben Donahue	12/18/2018	1.2	300	360
Prepare for and attend Trial on Arbitration; Judge ruled Motion to Amend granted; No motion to compel arbitration pending; Extended discovery 60 days + Motion for claim cert 90 days out; debreif w/ witness and counsel strategize for filing motion for claim cert, and further discovery - w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	12/18/2018	6.7	300	2010
Make changes to amended complaint.	Ben Donahue	12/19/2018	3.2	300	960
Mtg w/ BD over discovery and filing motion for claim cert.	Thomas Hallett	12/19/2018	0.4	300	120
Chat with Sara regarding amendments. Make amendments.	Ben Donahue	12/20/2018	2.1	300	630

Make changes to amended complaint	Ben Donahue	12/20/2018	1.5	300	450
Mtg w/ Bob Cummins re: disc issues - 30 (b) (6) motion and Third Req for Prod Doc's.	Thomas Hallett	12/20/2018	1	300	300
TC with Melissa.	Ben Donahue	12/21/2018	0.3	300	90
Finalize and file amended complaint; draft letter to court.	Ben Donahue	12/26/2018	2.1	300	630
Discovery planning.	Ben Donahue	12/27/2018	1	300	300
Trial prep; mtg w/ Jim Tilton; travel to Bath.	Thomas Hallett	12/27/2018	4.7	300	1410
Review disc -need to get out Monday.	Thomas Hallett	12/28/2018	0.75	300	225
Draft/research motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/2/2019	10.2	300	3060
Drafted letter to Aromando re Court Order and Third RPD	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/2/2019	0.3	100	30
Meeting w/ BND re: discovery. Letter to Aromando.	Thomas Hallett	1/2/2019	1.2	300	360
Discussion with TH regarding discovery; other issues.	Ben Donahue	1/3/2019	0.6	300	180
Email to Aromando.	Thomas Hallett	1/3/2019	0.2	300	60
Review Aromondo letter; tc with bob about the same.	Ben Donahue	1/4/2019	0.7	300	210
Review of Aromando letter; TC w/ Bob re: discovery.	Thomas Hallett	1/4/2019	0.8	300	240
Emails to Cummins and KVS.	Thomas Hallett	1/5/2019	0.3	300	90
Research regarding class cert and door-to-door issues; draft memorandum regarding the same.	Ben Donahue	1/7/2019	8.2	300	2460
Edits/formatting to response letter to Aromando re third RPD and depositions of witnesses	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/7/2019	0.3	100	30
Review outline and prior drafts of motion to certify completed in 2018.	Ben Donahue	1/8/2019	2	300	600
Begin outlining Motion for Class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/9/2019	5.2	300	1560
Draft motion for cert.	Ben Donahue	1/15/2019	3.2	300	960
edits to notice of deposition of Spark	Kiersten Van Syckle	1/15/2019	0.3	100	30
Draft motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/16/2019	2.3	300	690
Draft motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	1/17/2019	2	300	600
Research regarding arbitration issues related to our motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	1/21/2019	5.8	300	1740
TC with claims admin company; draft motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	1/23/2019	1.7	300	510
Review Court Order; mtg w/ Ben; TC w/ Bob.	Thomas Hallett	1/23/2019	0.75	300	225
TCs with potential witnesses.	Ben Donahue	1/24/2019	0.5	300	150
Draft motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	1/24/2019	2.1	300	630
Draft motion to certify; extensive research regarding causation issues, RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	1/30/2019	4.5	300	1350
Draft motion for class cert; discussion with witnesses regarding depositions.	Ben Donahue	1/31/2019	9.5	300	2850

Travel to and attend depositions.	Ben Donahue	2/1/2019	8.5	300	2550
Draft motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	2/2/2019	2.3	300	690
Travel to and attend deposition of Mathew Prior.	Ben Donahue	2/4/2019	4.2	300	1260
Meeting with Attorney Hallett; Prepare with client and attend Tilton depo	Ben Donahue	2/5/2019	7.5	300	2250
Mtg w/ BD re: depositions; case strategy.	Thomas Hallett	2/5/2019	0.5	300	150
Attend Auger Depo.	Ben Donahue	2/6/2019	2	300	600
Draft motion for cert; research related to causation and damages issues.	Ben Donahue	2/7/2019	6.7	300	2010
Auger Depo and research class cert issues.	Ben Donahue	2/8/2019	8.5	300	2550
Draft motion for class cert; research common proof issues.	Ben Donahue	2/11/2019	4.2	300	1260
Draft motion for class cert; document review.	Ben Donahue	2/13/2019	4	300	1200
Began drafting expert affidavit.	Ben Donahue	2/13/2019	2.3	300	690
Draft motion for class cert; review motion to compel arbitration; research arbitration issues; communications with opposing counsel regarding arbitration.	Ben Donahue	2/15/2019	8.8	300	2640
Work with experts to draft affidavit and review related materials.	Ben Donahue	2/18/2019	9.2	300	2760
Draft motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	2/19/2019	8.7	300	2610
Review expert cert for Rick; mtg w/ BD re: strategy.	Thomas Hallett	2/19/2019	1.1	300	330
Draft Tabors and Hornby Decs.	Ben Donahue	2/20/2019	8.4	300	2520
Meeting with Attorney Hallett and Bob Cummins re: certification	Ben Donahue	2/22/2019	1	300	300
TC w/ Bob Cummins and BD. Mtg w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	2/22/2019	1.15	300	345
Draft motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	2/25/2019	8.4	300	2520
Extensive research regarding RICO issues.	Ben Donahue	2/26/2019	6.2	300	1860
Research re motion for class cert.	Ben Donahue	2/27/2019	3.8	300	1140
uploaded discovery production to Lexbe drop box for processing - sent Ingestion Form to Erin	Kiersten Van Syckle	2/27/2019	0.3	100	30
Research regarding Rule 23 issues; motion drafting.	Ben Donahue	3/4/2019	10.2	300	3060
Document review; motion outline.	Ben Donahue	3/5/2019	9.2	300	2760
Motion to Compel and Review.	Thomas Hallett	3/5/2019	0.9	300	270
Research and drafting motion to certify.	Ben Donahue	3/6/2019	5.2	300	1560
Motion to Compel - final review; research state cooling off statute; prepare for upcoming deposition - Nadeau 30 (b) (6).	Thomas Hallett	3/6/2019	3.75	300	1125
Research predominance issues; draft motion.	Ben Donahue	3/7/2019	6	300	1800
Meeting w/ Dave Loranger.	Thomas Hallett	3/7/2019	0.6	300	180
Draft motion; research commonality issues.	Ben Donahue	3/8/2019	11.2	300	3360
Draft motion; depo review.	Ben Donahue	3/9/2019	8.2	300	2460
Draft motion to certify; document review.	Ben Donahue	3/10/2019	9.4	300	2820
Conversation with PI; draft.	Ben Donahue	3/11/2019	3.2	300	960



Draft motion; review deposition testimony.	Ben Donahue	3/11/2019	5.3	300	1590
Draft motion; research predominance and typicality issues.	Ben Donahue	3/12/2019	10.6	300	3180
Draft motion; revise commonality analysis.	Ben Donahue	3/13/2019	10.9	300	3270
Draft motion; review deposition testimony and related documents.	Ben Donahue	3/14/2019	12	300	3600
Draft motion; research predominance issues; Meeting with Attorney Hallett	Ben Donahue	3/15/2019	14.9	300	4470
Mtg with BD; review of depo; potential exhibits.	Thomas Hallett	3/15/2019	1.75	300	525
Draft motion; document and deposition review; research Rule 23 issues.	Ben Donahue	3/16/2019	3.2	300	960
Review customer complaints.	Thomas Hallett	3/17/2019	3.5	300	1050
Review documents and deposition testimony; draft motion.	Ben Donahue	3/18/2019	13	300	3900
Continue reviewing customer complaints.	Thomas Hallett	3/18/2019	2.75	300	825
Began review and consolidation of complaints and actions noted in Excel	Andrew Ambrose	3/19/2019	1	100	100
Review deposition testimony; draft motion.	Ben Donahue	3/19/2019	15.2	300	4560
Prepare for depositions of Nadeau and 30 (b) (6).	Thomas Hallett	3/19/2019	6.5	300	1950
Reviewed excel sheets from SparkEnergy regarding door to door. Drafted consolidated excel sheet.	Andrew Ambrose	3/20/2019	1.5	100	150
Review exhibits; check citations.	Ben Donahue	3/20/2019	16.2	300	4860
Deposition of Sandra Nadeau.	Thomas Hallett	3/20/2019	6	300	1800
Draft motion; review documents.	Ben Donahue	3/21/2019	17.4	300	5220
Motion for Certification - prep work.	Thomas Hallett	3/21/2019	7.75	300	2325
Assist in drafting and completing motion for class cert.	Athena Lavigne	3/22/2019	6.5	100	650
Compile exhibits; revise motion; file.	Ben Donahue	3/22/2019	19.2	300	5760
Final draft of Motion for Certification.	Thomas Hallett	3/22/2019	14.5	300	4350
Review motion; deal with appendix issues; file exhibits.	Ben Donahue	3/25/2019	8.2	300	2460
Deal with discovery issues re motion to compel.	Ben Donahue	3/26/2019	2.3	300	690
Research attachment issues for EMF, etc.	Thomas Hallett	3/28/2019	1.75	300	525
Document review; emails with clients regarding motion to certify and case status.	Ben Donahue	3/31/2019	9	300	2700
Draft discovery dispute letter.	Ben Donahue	4/3/2019	3.4	300	1020
Prepare for hearing on discovery dispute; document review. Telephone conference with Judge Walker	Ben Donahue	4/4/2019	8.05	300	2415
Telephonic hearing with Judge Walker.	Thomas Hallett	4/4/2019	0.75	300	225
Meeting with Attorney Hallett re: discovery issues and arbitration strategy	Ben Donahue	4/5/2019	0.75	300	225
Mtg w/ BD re: case issues; discovery issue; strategy on Motion for Arbitration.	Thomas Hallett	4/5/2019	0.75	300	225

Emails with Opposing counsel re extending time.	Ben Donahue	4/8/2019	0.3	300	90
Draft motion to extend time.	Ben Donahue	4/9/2019	1.1	300	330
Letter to clients re class certification.	Ben Donahue	4/16/2019	0.9	300	270
Investigate door to door sales at immigrant community.	Ben Donahue	4/17/2019	2	300	600
Motion for Certification - preparation.	Thomas Hallett	4/21/2019	7.75	300	2325
Review discovery Order w/ BD	Thomas Hallett	4/22/2019	0.9	300	270
Review order on discovery dispute; discuss with TFH.	Ben Donahue	4/22/2019	0.9	300	270
TC with clerk.	Ben Donahue	4/25/2019	0.3	300	90
Discussion with Court deadline issue.	Ben Donahue	4/25/2019	0.3	300	90
Begin drafting Opposition to Motion to Compel.	Ben Donahue	4/25/2019	2.5	300	750
Document review.	Ben Donahue	4/29/2019	1.8	300	540
Research regarding arbitration issues; Daubert issues.	Ben Donahue	5/6/2019	3.5	300	1050
Review opp to cert and Daubert motion.	Ben Donahue	5/10/2019	1.5	300	450
Review Daubert Motion	Thomas Hallett	5/10/2019	1.1	300	330
Review filings.	Ben Donahue	5/15/2019	1.8	300	540
Research daubert issues.	Ben Donahue	5/16/2019	0.9	300	270
Research certification issues; begin outlining reply brief. Meeting with TFH re: certification issues	Ben Donahue	5/21/2019	9.7	300	2910
Mtg w/ BND.	Thomas Hallett	5/21/2019	1	300	300
Draft reply.	Ben Donahue	5/22/2019	8.5	300	2550
Research and draft reply brief.	Ben Donahue	5/23/2019	4.2	300	1260
Draft reply and related research.	Ben Donahue	5/24/2019	6.3	300	1890
Draft and research issues related to reply brief.	Ben Donahue	5/25/2019	5.6	300	1680
Draft and research.	Ben Donahue	5/26/2019	6.7	300	2010
Draft and research issues related to reply brief and daubert.	Ben Donahue	5/27/2019	11.4	300	3420
Draft and research related to reply brief and daubert.	Ben Donahue	5/28/2019	14.2	300	4260
Prepare for depo.	Thomas Hallett	5/28/2019	6.5	300	1950
Draft reply and related research.	Ben Donahue	5/29/2019	9.9	300	2970
Emailed OC Plaintiffs' Second Amended Notice of Depo of EM - changed location to Pierce Atwood	Kiersten Van Syckle	5/29/2019	0.3	100	30
Depo prep.	Thomas Hallett	5/29/2019	3.75	300	1125
Review documents, deposition testimony. Draft.	Ben Donahue	5/30/2019	9.8	300	2940
Attend deposition. 2 TC w BD. Research Reach and apply for indemnification.	Thomas Hallett	5/30/2019	9	300	2700
Draft; document review.	Ben Donahue	5/31/2019	8.5	300	2550
Ben explained case to me with some objectives to meet for the summer	Dan Feldman	5/31/2019	1	300	300

Meeting w/ Melissa Hewey re: possible settlement. Mtg w/ BD to discuss settlement issues; TC w/ Bob Cummins re: settlement issues.	Thomas Hallett	5/31/2019	1.8	300	540
Review materials from Dean v. Clavet's state court cases. Emails w/ Cummins; mtg w/ BD; TC w/ Aromando re: mediation - on board.	Thomas Hallett	5/31/2019	1.05	300	315
Draft; research daubert issues; doc review.	Ben Donahue	6/1/2019	4.8	300	1440
Draft; document review.	Ben Donahue	6/2/2019	7.4	300	2220
Draft opposition to motion to compel; research arbitration issues.	Ben Donahue	6/3/2019	6.4	300	1920
TC with experts; draft opposition to motion to exclude.	Ben Donahue	6/4/2019	9.1	300	2730
TC w/ Clerk re: Nivision availability; emails.	Thomas Hallett	6/4/2019	0.5	300	150
Draft opposition to motion to compel.	Ben Donahue	6/5/2019	10.5	300	3150
Schedule mediation and conditions. Emails and TC w/ Court.	Thomas Hallett	6/5/2019	0.5	300	150
Draft and file Arbitration response.	Ben Donahue	6/6/2019	15.4	300	4620
Daubert response	Ben Donahue	6/8/2019	5.4	300	1620
Research and draft daubert response.	Ben Donahue	6/9/2019	8.2	300	2460
Draft Daubert response.	Ben Donahue	6/10/2019	14.6	300	4380
Draft and research Daubert response.	Ben Donahue	6/11/2019	12.8	300	3840
Draft and research Daubert response.	Ben Donahue	6/12/2019	14.7	300	4410
Draft and research Daubert response.	Ben Donahue	6/13/2019	16.8	300	5040
Draft and File reply brief; daubert response; OA response.	Ben Donahue	6/14/2019	15.8	300	4740
Work on filing opposition memos; review and revise citations; depos cites, etc.	Thomas Hallett	6/14/2019	5.25	300	1575
Review expenses and add in expert fees not previously billed to client. Check and re-check that all expenses are accounted for. Discussions w/ BD and KVS about expenses and hours billed.	Athena Lavigne	6/24/2019	1	100	100
Draft mediation statement.	Ben Donahue	6/24/2019	8.3	300	2490
Consult w/ BD and BC re: mediation brief; review and revise same.	Thomas Hallett	6/24/2019	1.2	300	360
Settlement preparations.	Ben Donahue	6/26/2019	2.3	300	690
Prepare for and participate in conference call with Court re upcoming JSC.	Ben Donahue	6/26/2019	2.1	300	630
Review holdings of Dean and Clavet; TC w/ Court and Melissa.	Thomas Hallett	6/26/2019	2.2	300	660
Mediation prep.	Ben Donahue	6/27/2019	1.2	300	360
Prepare for mediation.	Ben Donahue	6/28/2019	4.3	300	1290
Mediation prep.	Thomas Hallett	6/28/2019	5	300	1500
Prepare for mediation.	Ben Donahue	6/30/2019	4.2	300	1260
Travel to and attend Mediation.	Ben Donahue	7/1/2019	14.2	300	4260
Attend and travel to mediation in Bangor.	Thomas Hallett	7/1/2019	13.75	300	4125

Travel to and attend second day of mediation.	Ben Donahue	7/2/2019	15	300	4500
Attend and travel to mediation in Bangor.	Thomas Hallett	7/2/2019	13.5	300	4050
Letter to clients regarding potential settlement.	Ben Donahue	7/3/2019	2.3	300	690
Letters to clients re case status and settlement.	Ben Donahue	7/8/2019	4.7	300	1410
Expert search.	Ben Donahue	7/10/2019	2.4	300	720
TC w/ Melissa; mtg w/ BD re: additional 15 days to solve issues between the defendants - consented to enlargement.	Thomas Hallett	7/11/2019	0.7	300	210
Prepare for and participate in telephonic conference with court.	Ben Donahue	7/16/2019	1.4	300	420
Conference call w/ Ct. - prepare for call w/ BD.	Thomas Hallett	7/16/2019	0.5	300	150
Meet with Bob, TFH regarding settlement.	Ben Donahue	9/11/2019	0.7	300	210
Mtg w/ Cummins and BD re: process at end of month	Thomas Hallett	9/11/2019	1	300	300
TC w/ Aromando.	Thomas Hallett	9/20/2019	0.5	300	150
TC w/ Armando.	Thomas Hallett	9/20/2019	0.5	300	150
Emails w/ Aromando and review motion.	Thomas Hallett	9/23/2019	0.5	300	150
Emails w/ Armando, review motion.	Thomas Hallett	9/23/2019	0.5	300	150
Review filings in coverage case; discuss impact on settlements with TFH.	Ben Donahue	10/11/2019	1.3	300	390
TC w/ John Aromando; mtg w/ Ben re: strategy going forward - settlement issues.	Thomas Hallett	10/22/2019	1.1	300	330
Research settlement issues; notice issues.	Ben Donahue	10/25/2019	3.4	300	1020
Initial review of settlement documents.	Ben Donahue	01/02/2020	8.7	300	2610
Redline settlement agreement.	Ben Donahue	01/06/2020	2.6	300	780
Communications with potential settlement administrator.	Ben Donahue	01/07/2020	0.4	300	120
Deadline settlement agreement; legal research regarding electronic notice issues.	Ben Donahue	01/07/2020	8.2	300	2460
Meeting with TFH and RBC regarding claims administration.	Ben Donahue	01/07/2020	1.2	300	360
Review settlement agreement and attachments. Review billing entries.	Tom Hallett	01/07/2020	4.8	300	1440
Redline settlement agreement.	Ben Donahue	01/08/2020	9.2	300	2760
Review settlement documents; mtg w/ BD and BC re: settlement docs.	Tom Hallett	01/08/2020	2.5	300	750
Draft settlement agreement.	Ben Donahue	01/09/2020	6.1	300	1830
Review, revise and supplement BD's revisions of settlement agreement.	Tom Hallett	01/09/2020	4.25	300	1275
Draft and return settlement agreement to defense counsel.	Ben Donahue	01/10/2020	4.5	300	1350

Final review and revision of Settlement Agreement; review revision of Short Form Notice; mtg w/ BD re: Short Form Notice and Settlement Agreement re: provisions primarily.	Tom Hallett	01/10/2020	4.4	300	1320
Review and begin redlining Motion for Cert. of Settlement Class.	Ben Donahue	01/13/2020	4.3	300	1290
Review KKC claims updated proposal.	Ben Donahue	01/16/2020	0.4	300	120
Work on settlement agreement.	Ben Donahue	01/17/2020	2.3	300	690
Discuss settlement issues with TFH.	Ben Donahue	01/21/2020	1.3	300	390
TC with Barry Hobbins; meeting with TFH and RC regarding settlement.	Ben Donahue	01/22/2020	2	300	600
Emails re: pricing for proposed notice.	Tom Hallett	01/22/2020	0.3	300	90
Review defendants' concerns regarding settlement agreement; prepare response.	Ben Donahue	01/26/2020	2.1	300	630
Prepare for meeting with defense counsel regarding the settlement agreement; research regarding notice programs.	Ben Donahue	01/27/2020	4.1	300	1230
Review letter from Aromando; emails w/ Ben; review ftc analysis; settlement dates; mtg w/ PA; draft motion to enlarge deadline.	Tom Hallett	01/27/2020	4.8	300	1440
Prepare for meeting with defense counsel regarding the settlement agreement.	Ben Donahue	01/28/2020	4.5	300	1350
Draft press release; TC with Attorney Cummins regarding Settlement.	Ben Donahue	01/29/2020	1.2	300	360
Work on Motion for Preliminary Approval.	Ben Donahue	02/03/2020	2.9	300	870
TC with BND re: settlement	Thomas Hallett	2/12/2020	0.5	300	150
TC with TFH regarding settlement and his discussion with defense counsel.	Ben Donahue	02/12/2020	0.5	300	150
TC with BD re: Defendants' notice proposal	Thomas Hallett	2/13/2020	0.4	300	120
TC with TFH re responding to defendants' most recent notice proposal.	Ben Donahue	02/13/2020	0.4	300	120
Emails and conversation with TFH regarding response to Defendants proposed notice.	Ben Donahue	02/14/2020	0.5	300	150
Communications with potential claims admin.	Ben Donahue	02/18/2020	0.4	300	120
Two meetings with TFH re: public statement language	Ben Donahue	2/24/2020	0.6	300	180
2 mtgs w/ Ben re: revision of language of public statement.	Tom Hallett	02/24/2020	0.6	300	180
Two TC with TFH re: response to Aromando changes to proposed public statement	Ben Donahue	2/26/2020	0.75	300	225
TC w/ Ben. Review response to Aromando.	Tom Hallett	02/26/2020	0.75	300	225
Review the Defendants' proposed changes.	Ben Donahue	02/27/2020	3.2	300	960
Revise new round of settlement agreement and related documents.	Ben Donahue	03/02/2020	6.2	300	1860
Revise Motion for Preliminary Approval; Notices.	Ben Donahue	03/03/2020	9.6	300	2880

Respond to Defendants' most recent concerns; emails with TFH and opposing counsel.	Ben Donahue	03/09/2020	2.3	300	690
TC w/ Ben RE final court submissions.	Tom Hallett	03/09/2020	0.5	300	150
Review and finalize settlement response.	Ben Donahue	03/11/2020	4.3	300	1290
Review and finalized settlement docs.	Ben Donahue	03/17/2020	1.5	300	450
Review final settlement documents.	Ben Donahue	03/19/2020	1.4	300	420
Finalized and file settlement documents.	Ben Donahue	03/20/2020	2.1	300	630
Emails with Attorney Aromondo; execute waiver of class counsel's claims.	Ben Donahue	03/25/2020	0.8	300	240
Letter to OC enclosing signed Exhibit G for settlement	Kiersten Van Syckle	05/08/2020	0.1		0.1
Review court's order; discuss next steps with TFH.	Ben Donahue	05/13/2020	1.2	300	360
Review Court order approving settlement. TC w/ BD.	Tom Hallett	05/13/2020	0.75	300	225
Emails and TC with TFH re: fee issues	Ben Donahue	5/26/2020	0.6	300	180
Emails w/ BD; meeting w/ BD RE fee issues; BD to finalize review of fees.	Tom Hallett	05/26/2020	0.6	300	180
Communications with K.Kayatta regarding claims status.	Ben Donahue	05/27/2020	0.8	300	240
Review billing to present to defendant.	Tom Hallett	05/28/2020	1.75	300	525
Emails with opposing counsel regarding website.	Ben Donahue	06/01/2020	0.5	300	150
Meeting with BD re: records	Thomas Hallett	6/3/2020	0.4	300	120
Review settlement documents; discuss books and records request with TFH.	Ben Donahue	06/03/2020	1.3	300	390
Discussions regarding claims forms; review settlement website; emails with opposing counsel regarding the same; TC with Heffler.	Ben Donahue	06/04/2020	3.2	300	960
Emails with TFH	Ben Donahue	6/4/2020	0.2	300	60
Emails w/ BD; review claims forms, TC claims representative.	Tom Hallett	06/04/2020	0.9	300	270
Website issues; TC with Heffler regarding the same; review settlement documents regarding related issues.	Ben Donahue	06/09/2020	2.3	300	690
Meeting with TFH re: settlement website	Tom Hallett	6/10/2020	0.7	300	210
Meeting w/ BD RE computer settlement site; review letter from Heffler including voice information system menu.	Tom Hallett	06/10/2020	0.9	300	270
TC with Heffler and opposing counsel regarding printing issues; postponing claims process; emails with opposing counsel; review motion to enlarge.	Ben Donahue	06/11/2020	2.4	300	720
Emails and TC with TFH re: claims form issues	Ben Donahue	6/11/2020	0.5	300	150
Emails; TC BD RE form issues.	Tom Hallett	06/11/2020	0.5	300	150

Multiple calls with Heffler regarding printing issues.	Ben Donahue	06/12/2020	3.4	300	1020
2 TC w/ BD; TC Aromando-left message. TC w/ Meaghan at Judge Walker's chambers.	Tom Hallett	06/12/2020	1.2	300	360
Emails class action members.	Tom Hallett	06/13/2020	0.75	300	225
Emails regarding claims process.	Ben Donahue	06/14/2020	0.7	300	210
Emails class members.	Tom Hallett	06/14/2020	0.4	300	120
Received three calls regarding email. Referred to settlement website.	Andrew Ambrose	06/15/2020	0.4		0.4
Deal with claims issues; incoming call volume for paralegals and other issues.	Ben Donahue	06/15/2020	4.9	300	1470
TC with TFH re: incoming claims and website issues	Ben Donahue	6/15/2020	0.7	300	210
Setting up links for class settlement info	David A. Weyrens	06/15/2020	1.5		1.5
TC w/ BD RE website status; 500 claims first 2 hours; email response website issues.	Tom Hallett	06/15/2020	0.7	300	210
Received seven calls regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/16/2020	1.3		1.3
Emails with clients regarding settlement status; emails with opposing counsel regarding claims forms sent to their office; general claims issues.	Ben Donahue	06/16/2020	2.1	300	630
Received eight calls regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/17/2020	1.8		1.8
Received five calls regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/18/2020	1.1		1.1
Deal with additional claims issues; TC with claims administrator; review emails from class members sent to office.	Ben Donahue	06/18/2020	3.4	300	1020
respond to settlement inquires	Mike Whipple	06/18/2020	3.5		3.5
Deal w/ issues from class calls and emails; emails from DW; TC w/ MW RE responding to class members-proper format.	Tom Hallett	06/18/2020	1.25	300	375
Received two calls regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/19/2020	0.6		0.6
Draft mass reply to class members who contacted regarding case and settlement.	Ben Donahue	06/22/2020	2.1	300	630
Received two calls regarding settlement packet.	Andrew Ambrose	06/23/2020	0.5		0.5
Conf w/ BD Objectors.	Tom Hallett	06/23/2020	0.3	300	90
Received one call regarding settlement packet.	Andrew Ambrose	06/24/2020	0.3		0.3
Deal with additional claimant issues; creating form email responses; review settlement agreement regarding notice requirements.	Ben Donahue	06/24/2020	3.7	300	1110

Received one call regarding settlement packet. Received Claim Form from Paul DuPrey. Left for Paralegal Donadio. Called 844 number for reference. Called Mr Mahoney back as well.	Andrew Ambrose	06/25/2020	0.8		0.8
TC with TFH regarding claims issues; emails with claims administrator; draft form letter.	Ben Donahue	06/25/2020	2.6	300	780
Received one call regarding settlement packet.	Andrew Ambrose	06/26/2020	0.2		0.2
Received two calls regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/29/2020	0.5		0.5
Claimant issues; website issues.	Ben Donahue	06/29/2020	2.1	300	630
Received one call regarding settlement documents.	Andrew Ambrose	06/30/2020	0.3		0.3
Review administrator's report; discuss with TFH; review settlement agreement regarding notice program.	Ben Donahue	06/30/2020	1.9	300	570
Meeting with TFH re: term Sheet	Ben Donahue	11/7/2019	0.5	300	150
Emails and TC's w/ Aromando over the last 7 days; mtg w/ BD re: Term Sheet.	Tom Hallett	11/07/2019	1.5	300	450
Meeting with TFH re: communications with Aromando	Ben Donahue	11/12/2019	0.3	300	90
Respond to emails from Aromando; mtg w/ BD; emails to Bob C.	Tom Hallett	11/12/2019	0.8	300	240
Discuss and respond to terms sheet.	Ben Donahue	11/20/2019	0.8	300	240
Settlement strategy session.	Ben Donahue	12/03/2019	4.2	300	1260
TC with TFH re: settlement agreement	Ben Donahue	12/4/2019	0.4	300	120
BND signed Term Sheet - emailed to all counsel and forwarded an original to Melissa Hewey for signature	Kiersten Van Syckle	12/04/2019	0.1667	100	16.66667
TC w/ Ben about settlement agreement negotiations; fees petition.	Tom Hallett	12/04/2019	0.4	300	120
TC with KCC claims management.	Ben Donahue	12/10/2019	0.5	300	150
Initial review of settlement documents.	Ben Donahue	12/20/2019	4.2	300	1260
Totals			3205.1		945946.6